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Corporate Finance Department

N Materials Management Division POSTED OPENING

BID OPPORTUNITY NO.: 88-2016

Winnipeg RESULTS Page 1 of 3

DESCRIPTION: SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF HAND PROTECTION

Submission 4:00pm. February 19, 2016

Deadline:

BIDDER TOTAL BID PRICE

SECTION A

McCordick Glove & Safety No bid

Acklands-Granger Inc 111,967.37

Imagewear (A Division of Marks) 99,154.52

vallen 91,868.57

ACT Equipment Sales Ltd. 108,819.54

Motion Canada 114,725.66
97,594.19

MacMor Industries Ltd. (Option 1) (part bid)

MacMor Industries Ltd. (Option 2) No bid
61,613.72

Latoplast Ltd. (part bid)

Raber Glove Manufacturing Co. Ltd. 173,905.25

Corporate Express Canada (Staples Advantage Canada) 60,934.94

B & H Canvas Ltd. (Rugged Country Manufacturing Ltd.) 95,676.50

119,937.30

ABC Fire & Safety
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BIDDER TOTAL BID PRICE
SECTION B
McCordick Glove & Safety 6,130.56
Acklands-Granger Inc 10,131.84
Imagewear (A Division of Marks) 8,772.00
Vallen 9,052.80
ACT Equipment Sales Ltd. 7,161.84
Motion Canada 9,127.44
MacMor Industries Ltd. (Option 1) 7,322.64
MacMor Industries Ltd. (Option 2) égng%(;
Latoplast Ltd. 3,509.76
Raber Glove Manufacturing Co. Ltd. No bid
Corporate Express Canada (Staples Advantage Canada) 5,498.16
B & H Canvas Ltd. (Rugged Country Manufacturing Ltd.) 4,324.80
9,482.40

ABC Fire & Safety
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ABC Fire & Safety

SECTION C
McCordick Glove & Safety 9,273.60
Acklands-Granger Inc 8,709.12
Imagewear (A Division of Marks) 5,564.16
Vallen 8,117.76
ACT Equipment Sales Ltd. 12,579.84
Motion Canada 10,080.00
MacMor Industries Ltd. (Option 1) 8,628.48
MacMor Industries Ltd. (Option 2) No bid
Latoplast Ltd. 8,413.44
Raber Glove Manufacturing Co. Ltd. No bid
Corporate Express Canada (Staples Advantage Canada) 9,434.88
B & H Canvas Ltd. (Rugged Country Manufacturing Ltd.) No bid
10,536.96
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