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DESCRIPTION: SUPPLY, DELIVERY AND INSTALLATION OF FITNESS EQUIPMENT

Submission 4:00PM. December 3, 2015

Deadline:

BIDDER TOTAL BID PRICE

Alternative 1 — Award as Whole

National Fitness Products $30,890.00 (partial bid)

Alternative 2 — Award by Iltem

Iltem 1 - $23,000.00

Item 2 - $6,495.00

Item 3 — no bid

Item 4 — no bid

Item 5 — no bid

Item 6 — no bid

Item 7 — no bid

Item 8 - $1,395.00

Alternative 1 — Award as Whole

Exercise Direct/Fitness Advantage Inc. $18,333.99 (partial bid)

Alternative 2 — Award by Item

Item 1 - $8,400.00

Item 2 - $4,950.00

Item 3 — $1,999.00

Item 4 — $790.00

Item 5 — $44.99

Item 6 — $800.00

Item 7 — no bid

Item 8 - $1,350.00

Alternative 1 — Award as Whole

Pulse Fitness $15,831.50 (partial bid)

Alternative 2 — Award by Item

Item 1 - $6,990.00

Item 2 - $3,495.00

Item 3 — $3,495.00

Item 4 — $1,300.00

Item 5 — $50.00

Item 6 — $950.00

Item 7 — $262.50

Item 8 - $1,550.00

Fitness Experience $18,685.00

Alternative 2 — Award by Iltem

Item 1 - $9,198.00

Item 2 - $5,449.00

Item 3 — $2,288.00

Item 4 — $676.00

Item 5 — $58.00

Item 6 — $728.00

Item 7 — $238.00

Item 8 - $1,348.00






