
 

 

Corporate Finance Department 

Materials Management Division 

  EVALUATED POSTED 
OPENING RESULTS 

BID OPPORTUNITY NO: 
 

Page 1 of 13 

847-2011 

DESCRIPTION: LEASE OF VEHICLES FOR 2012 (DAILY, WEEKLY, MONTHLY) 
 

Submission 
Deadline: 

4:00pm November 1, 2011 

BID  SUMMARY                                             

BID OPPORTUNITY 847-2011 

COMPACT SIZED 

AUTOMOBILE 

        

 PRICES SHOWN                                                                                     

do not include 

Enterprise Rent-A-Car 

Canada Limited 

The Driving Force Inc. Eastern Chrysler 

Plymouth Inc. 

Calmont                                         

Leasing Ltd. 

Ranjoy Sales & 

Leasing Ltd. o/a 

Budget Car & Truck 

Rental 

 PST or GST  $ Cost $ / km $ Cost $ / km $ Cost $ / km $ Cost $ / km $ Cost  $ / km 

Item 1 - DAILY  RATE  32.50 0.00 nb nb 29.73 0.08 nb nb 32.79 0.05 

Item 2 - WEEKLY  RATE  184.50 0.00 nb nb 172.73 0.08 nb nb 184.79 0.05 

Item 3 - 1 MONTH to less than 6  

MONTHS 

 652.50 0.00 nb nb 648.73 0.08 nb nb 664.79 0.05 

             

Legend    nb=no bid            

 



BID  SUMMARY                                             

BID OPPORTUNITY 847-2011 

MID-SIZED AUTOMOBILE         

 PRICES SHOWN                                                                                     

do not include 

Enterprise Rent-A-Car 

Canada Limited 

The Driving Force Inc. Eastern Chrysler 

Plymouth Inc. 

Calmont                                         

Leasing Ltd. 

Ranjoy Sales & 

Leasing Ltd. o/a 

Budget Car & Truck 

Rental 

 PST or GST  $ Cost $ / km $ Cost $ / km $ Cost $ / km $ Cost $ / km $ Cost $ / km 

Item 4 - DAILY  RATE  33.50 0.00 nb nb 32.73 0.08 nb nb 35.97 0.05 

Item 5 - WEEKLY  RATE  199.50 0.00 nb nb 194.73 0.08 nb nb 215.97 0.05 

Item 6 - 1 MONTH to less than 6  

MONTHS 

 752.50 0.00 nb nb 734.73 0.08 nb nb 748.79 0.05 

             

Legend    nb=no bid            

             

            



 

BID  SUMMARY                                             
BID OPPORTUNITY 847-2011 MINI PASSENGER VAN 

  PRICES SHOWN                                                                                     
do not include 

Enterprise Rent-
A-Car Canada 

Limited 

The Driving 
Force Inc. 

Eastern Chrysler 
Plymouth Inc. 

Calmont                                         
Leasing Ltd. 

Ranjoy Sales & Leasing Ltd. 
o/a Budget Car & Truck Rental 

  
PST or GST $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km 

 Item 10 - DAILY  RATE 44.50 0.00 nb nb 40.73 0.08 nb nb 54.97 0.05 

 Item 11 - WEEKLY  RATE 289.50 0.00 nb nb 235.73 0.08 nb nb 329.97 0.05 

 Item 12 - 1 MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS 852.50 0.00 nb nb 839.73 0.08 895.00 0.08 949.97 0.05 

                      

 Legend    nb=no bid                     

                      

$ Cost $ / km $ Cost $ / km $ Cost $ / km $ Cost $ / km $ Cost $ / km

35.50 0.00 nb nb 35.73 0.08 nb nb 36.97 0.05

219.50 0.00 nb nb 214.73 0.08 nb nb 221.97 0.05

798.50 0.00 nb nb 788.73 0.08 999.00 0.08 797.97 0.05

Ranjoy Sales & 

Leasing Ltd. o/a 

Budget Car & Truck 

PST or GST

 Item 7 - DAILY  RATE

PRICES SHOWN                                                                                     

do not include

Enterprise Rent-A-Car 

Canada Limited
The Driving Force Inc.
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FULL SIZE AUTOMOBILE

 Item 9 - 1 MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

BID  SUMMARY                                             

BID OPPORTUNITY 847-2011

 Item 8 - WEEKLY  RATE

Eastern Chrysler 

Plymouth Inc.

 Legend    nb=no bid

Calmont                                         

Leasing Ltd.



BID  SUMMARY                                             
BID OPPORTUNITY 847-2011 ½ TON CARGO VAN 

  PRICES SHOWN                                                                                     
do not include 

Enterprise Rent-
A-Car Canada 

Limited 

The Driving 
Force Inc. 

Eastern Chrysler 
Plymouth Inc. 

Calmont                                         
Leasing Ltd. 

Ranjoy Sales & Leasing Ltd. 
o/a Budget Car & Truck Rental 

  
PST or GST $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km 

 Item 13 - DAILY  RATE 52.50 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 49.97 0.05 

 Item 14 - WEEKLY  RATE 329.50 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 309.97 0.05 

 Item 15 - 1 MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS 872.50 0.00 958.00 0.15 nb nb 887.00 0.08 874.97 0.05 

                      

 Legend    nb=no bid                     

           

           

 

BID  SUMMARY                                             
BID OPPORTUNITY 847-2011 8-PASSENGER VAN 

  PRICES SHOWN                                                                                     
do not include 

Enterprise Rent-
A-Car Canada 

Limited 

The Driving Force 
Inc. 

Eastern Chrysler 
Plymouth Inc. 

Calmont                                         
Leasing Ltd. 

Ranjoy Sales & Leasing Ltd. 
o/a Budget Car & Truck 

Rental 

  
PST or GST $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km 

 Item 16 - DAILY  RATE nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 

 Item 17 - WEEKLY  RATE 895.50 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 

 Item 18 - 1 MONTH to less than 6  
MONTHS 

2,352.50 0.00 1,450.00 0.15 nb nb 2,360.00 0.08 nb nb 

                      

 Legend    nb=no bid                     



BID  SUMMARY                                             
BID OPPORTUNITY 847-2011 MID-SIZED SPORT UTILITY VEHICLE - 4WD 

  PRICES SHOWN                                                                                     
do not include 

Enterprise Rent-
A-Car Canada 

Limited 

The Driving Force 
Inc. 

Eastern Chrysler 
Plymouth Inc. 

Calmont                                         
Leasing Ltd. 

Ranjoy Sales & Leasing Ltd. 
o/a Budget Car & Truck Rental 

  
PST or GST $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km 

 Item 19 - DAILY  RATE 48.50 0.00 nb nb 45.73 0.08 nb nb 51.97 0.05 

 Item 20 - WEEKLY  RATE 289.50 0.00 nb nb 279.73 0.08 nb nb 309.97 0.05 

 Item 21 - 1 MONTH to less than 6  
MONTHS 

989.50 0.00 1,475.00 0.21 978.73 0.08 nb nb 985.97 0.05 

                      

 Legend    nb=no bid                     

 

BID  SUMMARY                                             
BID OPPORTUNITY 847-2011 FULL SIZED SPORT UTILITY VEHICLE - 4WD 

  PRICES SHOWN                                                                                     
do not include 

Enterprise Rent-
A-Car Canada 

Limited 

The Driving Force 
Inc. 

Eastern Chrysler 
Plymouth Inc. 

Calmont                                         
Leasing Ltd. 

Ranjoy Sales & Leasing Ltd. 
o/a Budget Car & Truck 

Rental 

  
PST or GST $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km 

 Item 22 - DAILY  RATE 99.50 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 99.89 0.05 

 Item 23 - WEEKLY  RATE 599.50 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 599.89 0.05 

 Item 24 - 1 MONTH to less than 6  
MONTHS 

1,549.50 0.00 1,795.00 0.21 nb nb 1,545.00 0.08 1,539.89 0.05 

                      

 Legend    nb=no bid                     

 



BID  SUMMARY                                             
BID OPPORTUNITY 847-2011 ¼ TON, EXTENDED CAB PICK-UP TRUCK - 2WD 

  PRICES SHOWN                                                                                     
do not include 

Enterprise Rent-
A-Car Canada 

Limited 

The Driving 
Force Inc. 

Eastern Chrysler 
Plymouth Inc. 

Calmont                                         
Leasing Ltd. 

Ranjoy Sales & Leasing Ltd. 
o/a Budget Car & Truck Rental 

  
PST or GST $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km 

 Item 25 - DAILY  RATE 49.50 0.00 nb nb 35.73 0.08 nb nb nb nb 

 Item 26 - WEEKLY  RATE 259.50 0.00 nb nb 223.73 0.08 nb nb nb nb 

 Item 27 - 1 MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS 762.50 0.00 nb nb 744.73 0.08 nb nb nb nb 

                      

 Legend    nb=no bid                     

 

BID  SUMMARY                                             
BID OPPORTUNITY 847-2011 ¼ TON, EXTENDED CAB PICK-UP TRUCK - 4WD 

  PRICES SHOWN                                                                                     
do not include 

Enterprise Rent-
A-Car Canada 

Limited 

The Driving 
Force Inc. 

Eastern Chrysler 
Plymouth Inc. 

Calmont                                         
Leasing Ltd. 

Ranjoy Sales & Leasing Ltd. 
o/a Budget Car & Truck Rental 

  
PST or GST $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km 

 Item 28 - DAILY  RATE 49.50 0.00 nb nb 35.73 0.08 nb nb nb nb 

 Item 29 - WEEKLY  RATE 259.50 0.00 nb nb 223.73 0.08 nb nb nb nb 

 Item 30 - 1 MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS 762.50 0.00 nb nb 744.73 0.08 nb nb nb nb 

                      

 Legend    nb=no bid                     

 



BID  SUMMARY                                             
BID OPPORTUNITY 847-2011 ½ TON, EXTENDED CAB PICK-UP TRUCK - 2WD 

  PRICES SHOWN                                                                                     
do not include 

Enterprise Rent-
A-Car Canada 

Limited 

The Driving Force 
Inc. 

Eastern Chrysler 
Plymouth Inc. 

Calmont                                         
Leasing Ltd. 

Ranjoy Sales & Leasing Ltd. 
o/a Budget Car & Truck Rental 

  
PST or GST $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km 

 Item 31 - DAILY  RATE 49.50 0.00 nb nb 41.73 0.08 nb nb 44.97 0.05 

 Item 32 - WEEKLY  RATE 279.50 0.00 nb nb 270.73 0.08 nb nb 274.97 0.05 

 Item 33 - 1 MONTH to less than 6  
MONTHS 

952.50 0.00 1,390.00 0.15 897.73 0.08 925.00 0.08 938.97 0.05 

                      

 Legend    nb=no bid                     

 

BID  SUMMARY                                             
BID OPPORTUNITY 847-2011 ½ TON, EXTENDED CAB PICK-UP TRUCK - 4WD 

  PRICES SHOWN                                                                                     
do not include 

Enterprise Rent-
A-Car Canada 

Limited 

The Driving Force 
Inc. 

Eastern Chrysler 
Plymouth Inc. 

Calmont                                         
Leasing Ltd. 

Ranjoy Sales & Leasing Ltd. 
o/a Budget Car & Truck Rental 

  
PST or GST $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km 

 Item 34 - DAILY  RATE 49.50 0.00 nb nb 41.73 0.08 nb nb 44.97 0.05 

 Item 35 - WEEKLY  RATE 279.50 0.00 nb nb 270.73 0.08 nb nb 274.97 0.05 

 Item 36 - 1 MONTH to less than 6  
MONTHS 

952.50 0.00 1,390.00 0.15 897.73 0.08 960.00 0.08 938.97 0.05 

                      

 Legend    nb=no bid                     

 



BID  SUMMARY                                             
BID OPPORTUNITY 847-2011 ¾ TON, EXTENDED CAB PICK-UP TRUCK - 2WD 

  PRICES SHOWN                                                                                     
do not include 

Enterprise Rent-
A-Car Canada 

Limited 

The Driving Force 
Inc. 

Eastern Chrysler 
Plymouth Inc. 

Calmont                                         
Leasing Ltd. 

Ranjoy Sales & Leasing Ltd. 
o/a Budget Car & Truck 

Rental 

  
PST or GST $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km 

 Item 37 - DAILY  RATE 99.50 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 98.97 0.05 

 Item 38 - WEEKLY  RATE 549.50 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 548.97 0.05 

 Item 39 - 1 MONTH to less than 6  
MONTHS 

1,312.50 0.00 1,390.00 0.21 1,289.73 0.08 1,369.00 0.08 1,305.97 0.05 

                      

 Legend    nb=no bid                     

 

BID  SUMMARY                                             
BID OPPORTUNITY 847-2011 ¾ TON, EXTENDED CAB PICK-UP TRUCK - 4WD 

  PRICES SHOWN                                                                                     
do not include 

Enterprise Rent-
A-Car Canada 

Limited 

The Driving Force 
Inc. 

Eastern Chrysler 
Plymouth Inc. 

Calmont                                         
Leasing Ltd. 

Ranjoy Sales & Leasing Ltd. 
o/a Budget Car & Truck 

Rental 

  
PST or GST $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km 

 Item 40 - DAILY  RATE 99.50 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 98.97 0.05 

 Item 41 - WEEKLY  RATE 549.50 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 548.97 0.05 

 Item 42 - 1 MONTH to less than 6  
MONTHS 

1,352.50 0.00 1,390.00 0.21 1,289.73 0.08 1,349.00 0.08 1,305.97 0.05 

                      

 Legend    nb=no bid                     

 



BID  SUMMARY                                             
BID OPPORTUNITY 847-2011 ½ TON, CREW CAB PICK-UP TRUCK - 2WD 

  PRICES SHOWN                                                                                     
do not include 

Enterprise Rent-
A-Car Canada 

Limited 

The Driving Force 
Inc. 

Eastern Chrysler 
Plymouth Inc. 

Calmont                                         
Leasing Ltd. 

Ranjoy Sales & Leasing Ltd. 
o/a Budget Car & Truck Rental 

  
PST or GST $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km 

 Item 43 - DAILY  RATE 49.50 0.00 nb nb 41.73 0.08 nb nb 44.97 0.05 

 Item 44 - WEEKLY  RATE 279.50 0.00 nb nb 270.73 0.08 nb nb 274.97 0.05 

 Item 45 - 1 MONTH to less than 6  
MONTHS 

952.50 0.00 1,390.00 0.21 897.73 0.08 979.00 0.08 938.97 0.05 

                      

 Legend    nb=no bid                     

 

BID  SUMMARY                                             
BID OPPORTUNITY 847-2011 ½ TON, CREW CAB PICK-UP TRUCK - 4WD 

  PRICES SHOWN                                                                                     
do not include 

Enterprise Rent-
A-Car Canada 

Limited 

The Driving Force 
Inc. 

Eastern Chrysler 
Plymouth Inc. 

Calmont                                         
Leasing Ltd. 

Ranjoy Sales & Leasing Ltd. 
o/a Budget Car & Truck Rental 

  
PST or GST $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km 

 Item 46 - DAILY  RATE 49.50 0.00 nb nb 41.73 0.08 nb nb 44.97 0.05 

 Item 47 - WEEKLY  RATE 279.50 0.00 nb nb 270.73 0.08 nb nb 274.97 0.05 

 Item 48 - 1 MONTH to less than 6  
MONTHS 

952.50 0.00 1,390.00 0.21 897.73 0.08 959.00 0.08 938.97 0.05 

                      

 Legend    nb=no bid                     

 



BID  SUMMARY                                             
BID OPPORTUNITY 847-2011 ¾ TON, CREW CAB PICK-UP TRUCK - 2WD 

  PRICES SHOWN                                                                                     
do not include 

Enterprise Rent-
A-Car Canada 

Limited 

The Driving Force 
Inc. 

Eastern Chrysler 
Plymouth Inc. 

Calmont                                         
Leasing Ltd. 

Ranjoy Sales & Leasing Ltd. 
o/a Budget Car & Truck 

Rental 

  
PST or GST $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km 

 Item 49 - DAILY  RATE 99.50 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 98.97 0.05 

 Item 50 - WEEKLY  RATE 549.50 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 548.97 0.05 

 Item 51 - 1 MONTH to less than 6  
MONTHS 

1,392.50 0.00 1,390.00 0.21 1,289.73 0.08 1,369.00 0.08 1,375.97 0.05 

                      

 Legend    nb=no bid                     

 

BID  SUMMARY                                             
BID OPPORTUNITY 847-2011 ¾ TON, CREW CAB PICK-UP TRUCK - 4WD 

  PRICES SHOWN                                                                                     
do not include 

Enterprise Rent-
A-Car Canada 

Limited 

The Driving Force 
Inc. 

Eastern Chrysler 
Plymouth Inc. 

Calmont                                         
Leasing Ltd. 

Ranjoy Sales & Leasing Ltd. 
o/a Budget Car & Truck 

Rental 

  
PST or GST $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km 

 Item 52 - DAILY  RATE 99.50 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 98.97 0.05 

 Item 53 - WEEKLY  RATE 549.50 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 548.97 0.05 

 Item 54 - 1 MONTH to less than 6  
MONTHS 

1,392.50 0.00 1,390.00 0.21 1,289.73 0.08 1,369.00 0.08 1,375.97 0.05 

                      

 Legend    nb=no bid                     

 



BID  SUMMARY                                             
BID OPPORTUNITY 847-2011 1-TON, EXTENDED CAB PICK-UP TRUCK - 2WD 

  PRICES SHOWN                                                                                     
do not include 

Enterprise Rent-
A-Car Canada 

Limited 

The Driving Force 
Inc. 

Eastern Chrysler 
Plymouth Inc. 

Calmont                                         
Leasing Ltd. 

Ranjoy Sales & Leasing Ltd. 
o/a Budget Car & Truck 

Rental 

  
PST or GST $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km 

 Item 55 - DAILY  RATE 125.50 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 

 Item 56 - WEEKLY  RATE 649.50 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 

 Item 57 - 1 MONTH to less than 6  
MONTHS 

1,522.50 0.00 1,490.00 0.21 nb nb 1,559.00 0.08 nb nb 

                      

 Legend    nb=no bid                     

 

BID  SUMMARY                                             
BID OPPORTUNITY 847-2011 1-TON, EXTENDED CAB PICK-UP TRUCK - 4WD 

  PRICES SHOWN                                                                                     
do not include 

Enterprise Rent-
A-Car Canada 

Limited 

The Driving Force 
Inc. 

Eastern Chrysler 
Plymouth Inc. 

Calmont                                         
Leasing Ltd. 

Ranjoy Sales & Leasing Ltd. 
o/a Budget Car & Truck 

Rental 

  
PST or GST $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km 

 Item 58 - DAILY  RATE 125.50 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 

 Item 59 - WEEKLY  RATE 649.50 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 

 Item 60 - 1 MONTH to less than 6  
MONTHS 

1,522.50 0.00 1,490.00 0.21 nb nb 1,559.00 0.08 nb nb 

                      

 Legend    nb=no bid                     

 



BID  SUMMARY                                             
BID OPPORTUNITY 847-2011 1-TON, REGULAR OR EXTENDED CAB STAKE BODY TRUCK - 2WD 

  PRICES SHOWN                                                                                     
do not include 

Enterprise Rent-
A-Car Canada 

Limited 

The Driving Force 
Inc. 

Eastern Chrysler 
Plymouth Inc. 

Calmont                                         
Leasing Ltd. 

Ranjoy Sales & Leasing Ltd. 
o/a Budget Car & Truck 

Rental 

  
PST or GST $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km 

 Item 61 - DAILY  RATE nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 

 Item 62 - WEEKLY  RATE nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 

 Item 63 - 1 MONTH to less than 6  
MONTHS 

1,342.50 0.00 1,390.00 0.21 nb nb 1,337.00 0.08 nb nb 

                      

 Legend    nb=no bid                     

 

BID  SUMMARY                                             
BID OPPORTUNITY 847-2011 1-TON, REGULAR OR EXTENDED CAB DUMP BODY TRUCK - 2WD 

  PRICES SHOWN                                                                                     
do not include 

Enterprise Rent-
A-Car Canada 

Limited 

The Driving Force 
Inc. 

Eastern Chrysler 
Plymouth Inc. 

Calmont                                         
Leasing Ltd. 

Ranjoy Sales & Leasing Ltd. 
o/a Budget Car & Truck 

Rental 

  
PST or GST $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km 

 Item 64 - DAILY  RATE nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 

 Item 65 - WEEKLY  RATE nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 

 Item 66 - 1 MONTH to less than 6  
MONTHS 

1,592.50 0.00 1,675.00 0.21 nb nb 1,364.00 0.10 nb nb 

                      

 Legend    nb=no bid                     

 



BID  SUMMARY                                             
BID OPPORTUNITY 847-2011 14,000# GVWR, CREW CAB DUMP BODY TRUCK - 2WD 

  PRICES SHOWN                                                                                     
do not include 

Enterprise Rent-
A-Car Canada 

Limited 

The Driving Force 
Inc. 

Eastern Chrysler 
Plymouth Inc. 

Calmont                                         
Leasing Ltd. 

Ranjoy Sales & Leasing Ltd. 
o/a Budget Car & Truck 

Rental 

  
PST or GST $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km 

 Item 67 - DAILY  RATE nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 

 Item 68 - WEEKLY  RATE nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 

 Item 69 - 1 MONTH to less than 6  
MONTHS 

2,122.50 0.00 1,975.00 0.21 nb nb 2,099.00 0.10 nb nb 

                      

 Legend    nb=no bid                     

 

BID  SUMMARY                                             
BID OPPORTUNITY 847-2011 14,000# GVWR, CREW CAB DUMP BODY TRUCK - 4WD 

  PRICES SHOWN                                                                                     
do not include 

Enterprise Rent-
A-Car Canada 

Limited 

The Driving Force 
Inc. 

Eastern Chrysler 
Plymouth Inc. 

Calmont                                         
Leasing Ltd. 

Ranjoy Sales & Leasing Ltd. 
o/a Budget Car & Truck 

Rental 

  
PST or GST $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km $ Cost  $ / km 

 Item 70 - DAILY  RATE nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 

 Item 71 - WEEKLY  RATE nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 

 Item 72 - 1 MONTH to less than 6  
MONTHS 

2,122.50 0.00 1,975.00 0.21 nb nb 2,099.00 0.10 nb nb 

                      

 Legend    nb=no bid                     

 


