
$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

31.97 0.00 nb nb 31.50 0.08 nb nb 34.97 0.00

186.97 0.00 nb nb 185.00 0.08 nb nb 209.97 0.00

669.67 0.00 1,090.00 0.08 670.00 0.08 nb nb 829.97 0.05

599.97 0.00 945.00 0.08 619.00 0.08 nb nb 799.00 0.05

Item (3)  1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

Ranjoy Sales & 
Leasing Ltd. o/a 

Budget Car & Truck

COMPACT  SIZED  AUTOMOBILES

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

PAGE (1) OF 28

BID  RESULTS                   
TENDER  852-2009

PRICES  SHOWN              
do  not  include

Item (4)  6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Legend    nb=no bid

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

 Item (1) DAILY  RATE

Item (2) WEEKLY  RATE

ITEM   1....................Page  1  of  28



$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

33.97 0.00 nb nb 34.00 0.08 nb nb 35.97 0.00

199.97 0.00 nb nb 215.00 0.08 nb nb 215.97 0.00

749.97 0.00 1,190.00 0.08 765.00 0.08 nb nb 899.00 0.05

679.97 0.00 1,045.00 0.08 690.00 0.08 nb nb 869.00 0.05

MID-SIZED  AUTOMOBILES

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Ranjoy Sales & 
Leasing Ltd. o/a 

Budget Car & Truck

BID  RESULTS                    
TENDER  852-2009

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

 Item (5) DAILY  RATE

Item (6) WEEKLY  RATE

Item (7)  1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

PAGE (2) OF 28

Item (8)  6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Legend    nb=no bid

ITEM   2....................Page  2  of  28



$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

34.97 0.00 nb nb 37.00 0.08 nb nb 36.97 0.00

217.97 0.00 nb nb 225.00 0.08 nb nb 221.97 0.00

798.97 0.00 1,260.00 0.08 818.00 0.08 nb nb 949.00 0.05

738.97 0.00 1,145.00 0.08 756.00 0.08 nb nb 919.00 0.05

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Ranjoy Sales & 
Leasing Ltd. o/a 

Budget Car & Truck
P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

 Item (9) DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

PAGE (3) OF 28

BID  RESULTS                    
TENDER  852-2009

Item (10) WEEKLY  RATE

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

Legend    nb=no bid

FULL  SIZED  AUTOMOBILES

Item (11)  1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

Item (12)  6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

ITEM   3....................Page  3  of  28



$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

44.97 0.00 nb nb 43.00 0.08 nb nb 54.97 0.00

297.97 0.00 nb nb 243.00 0.08 nb nb 329.97 0.00

997.97 0.00 1,300.00 0.08 856.00 0.08 nb nb 1,299.00 0.05

897.97 0.00 1,195.00 0.08 756.00 0.08 nb nb 1,279.00 0.05

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Ranjoy Sales & 
Leasing Ltd. o/a 

Budget Car & Truck
P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

 Item (13) DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

PAGE (4) OF 28

BID  RESULTS                    
TENDER  852-2009

Item (14) WEEKLY  RATE

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

Legend    nb=no bid

MINI PASSENGER VAN

Item (15)  1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

Item (16)  6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

ITEM   4....................Page  4  of  28



$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

52.97 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 39.97 0.05

328.97 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 229.97 0.05

979.97 0.00 1,025.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb 899.00 0.05

897.97 0.00 950.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb 899.00 0.05

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Ranjoy Sales & 
Leasing Ltd. o/a 

Budget Car & Truck
P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

 Item (17) DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

PAGE (5) OF 28

BID  RESULTS                    
TENDER  852-2009

Item (18) WEEKLY  RATE

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

Legend    nb=no bid

1/2 TON CARGO VAN

Item (19)  1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

Item (20)  6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

ITEM   5....................Page  5  of  28



$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb 100.00 0.15 nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb 675.00 0.15 nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb 2,700.00 0.15 nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb 2,600.00 0.15 nb nb nb nb

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Ranjoy Sales & 
Leasing Ltd. o/a 

Budget Car & Truck
P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

 Item (21) DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

PAGE (6) OF 28

BID  RESULTS                    
TENDER  852-2009

Item (22) WEEKLY  RATE

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

Legend    nb=no bid

8-PASSENGER VAN

Item (23)  1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

Item (24)  6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

ITEM   6....................Page  6  of  28



$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

49.97 0.00 nb nb 49.00 0.08 nb nb 51.97 0.00

298.97 0.00 nb nb 289.00 0.08 nb nb 309.97 0.00

1,149.97 0.00 1,475.00 0.08 992.00 0.08 nb nb 1,229.00 0.05

1,049.97 0.00 1,250.00 0.08 925.00 0.08 nb nb 1,229.00 0.05

Item (26) WEEKLY  RATE

Item (27)  1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

Item (28)  6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

 Item (25) DAILY  RATE

MID-SIZED SPORT UTILITY VEHICLE - 4WDBID  RESULTS                    
TENDER  852-2009

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Ranjoy Sales & 
Leasing Ltd. o/a 

Budget Car & Truck
PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

Legend    nb=no bid

PAGE (7) OF 28

ITEM   7....................Page  7  of  28



$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

97.49 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

549.97 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

1,499.97 0.00 1,595.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb nb nb

1,349.97 0.00 1,350.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb nb nb

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Ranjoy Sales & 
Leasing Ltd. o/a 

Budget Car & Truck
P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

 Item (29) DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

PAGE (8) OF 28

BID  RESULTS                    
TENDER  852-2009

Item (30 WEEKLY  RATE

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

Legend    nb=no bid

FULL  SIZED  SPORT UTILITY VEHICLE - 4WD

Item (31)  1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

Item (32)  6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

ITEM   8....................Page  8  of  28



$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

49.97 0.00 nb nb 39.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

269.97 0.00 nb nb 229.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

1,039.97 0.00 nb nb 862.00 0.08 1,184.00 0.08 nb nb

939.97 0.00 nb nb 766.00 0.08 1,034.00 0.08 nb nb

Item (34) WEEKLY  RATE

Item (35)  1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

Item (36)  6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

 Item (33)DAILY  RATE

1/4 TON, EXTENDED CAB PICK-UP TRUCK - 2WDBID  RESULTS                    
TENDER  852-2009

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Ranjoy Sales & 
Leasing Ltd. o/a 

Budget Car & Truck
PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

Legend    nb=no bid

PAGE (9) OF 28

ITEM   9....................Page  9  of  28



$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

49.97 0.00 nb nb 36.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

269.97 0.00 nb nb 229.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

1,039.97 0.00 1,085.00 0.08 862.00 0.08 1,184.00 0.08 nb nb

939.97 0.00 895.00 0.08 766.00 0.08 1,034.00 0.08 nb nb

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Ranjoy Sales & 
Leasing Ltd. o/a 

Budget Car & Truck
P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

 Item (37) DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

PAGE (10) OF 28

BID  RESULTS                    
TENDER  852-2009

Item (38) WEEKLY  RATE

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

Legend    nb=no bid

1/4 TON, EXTENDED CAB PICK-UP TRUCK - 4WD

Item (39)  1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

Item (40)  6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

ITEM   10....................Page  10  of  28



$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

99.97 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

549.97 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

2,497.97 0.00 1,185.00 0.08 nb nb 1,095.00 0.08 nb nb

2,397.97 0.00 995.00 0.08 nb nb 965.00 0.08 nb nb

Item (42) WEEKLY  RATE

Item (43)  1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

Item (44)  6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

 Item (41) DAILY  RATE

1/2 TON PICK-UP TRUCK - 2WDBID  RESULTS                    
TENDER  852-2009

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Ranjoy Sales & 
Leasing Ltd. o/a 

Budget Car & Truck
PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

Legend    nb=no bid

PAGE (11) OF 28
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$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

99.97 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 48.97 nb

549.97 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 299.97 nb

2,497.97 0.00 1,185.00 0.08 nb nb 1,126.00 0.08 1,149.00 0.05

2,397.97 0.00 995.00 0.08 nb nb 994.00 0.08 1,129.00 0.05

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Ranjoy Sales & 
Leasing Ltd. o/a 

Budget Car & Truck
P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

 Item (45) DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

PAGE (12) OF 28

BID  RESULTS                    
TENDER  852-2009

Item (46) WEEKLY  RATE

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

Legend    nb=no bid

1/2 TON PICK-UP TRUCK - 4WD

Item (47)  1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

Item (48)  6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

ITEM   12....................Page  12  of  28



$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

99.97 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 109.99 0.00

549.97 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 629.99 0.00

2,497.97 0.00 1,295.00 0.08 nb nb 1,214.00 0.08 2,339.99 0.00

2,397.97 0.00 1,175.00 0.08 nb nb 1,079.00 0.08 2,319.99 0.00

Item (50) WEEKLY  RATE

Item (51)  1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

Item (52)  6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

 Item (49) DAILY  RATE

3/4 TON PICK-UP TRUCK - 2WDBID  RESULTS                    
TENDER  852-2009

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Ranjoy Sales & 
Leasing Ltd. o/a 

Budget Car & Truck
PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

Legend    nb=no bid

PAGE (13) OF 28
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$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

99.97 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 109.99 0.00

549.97 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 629.99 0.00

2,497.97 0.00 1,295.00 0.08 nb nb 1,343.00 0.08 2,339.99 0.00

2,397.97 0.00 1,175.00 0.08 nb nb 1,204.00 0.08 2,319.99 0.00

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Ranjoy Sales & 
Leasing Ltd. o/a 

Budget Car & Truck
P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

 Item (53) DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

PAGE (14) OF 28

BID  RESULTS                    
TENDER  852-2009

Item (54) WEEKLY  RATE

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

Legend    nb=no bid

3/4 TON PICK-UP TRUCK - 4WD

Item (55)  1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

Item (56)  6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

ITEM   14....................Page  14  of  28



$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

49.97 0.00 nb nb 45.00 0.08 nb nb 53.99 0.00

289.97 0.00 nb nb 275.00 0.08 nb nb 344.99 0.00

1,089.97 0.00 1,295.00 0.08 963.00 0.08 1,250.00 0.08 1,199.99 0.00

989.97 0.00 1,175.00 0.08 863.00 0.08 1,052.00 0.08 1,179.99 0.00

BID  RESULTS                    
TENDER  852-2009

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

1/2 TON, EXTENDED CAB PICK-UP TRUCK - 2WD
Ranjoy Sales & 
Leasing Ltd. o/a 

Budget Car & Truck
P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

 Item (57) DAILY  RATE

Item (58) WEEKLY  RATE

Item (59)  1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

PAGE (15) OF 28

Item (60)  6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Legend    nb=no bid

ITEM   15....................Page  15  of  28



$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

49.97 0.00 nb nb 45.00 0.08 nb nb 48.97 0.00

289.97 0.00 nb nb 275.00 0.08 nb nb 299.97 0.00

1,089.97 0.00 1,050.00 0.08 963.00 0.08 1,199.00 0.08 1,149.00 0.05

989.97 0.00 950.00 0.08 863.00 0.08 1,099.00 0.08 1,129.00 0.05

Ranjoy Sales & 
Leasing Ltd. o/a 

Budget Car & Truck
P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

 Item (61) DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

BID  RESULTS                    
TENDER  852-2009

Legend    nb=no bid

PAGE (16) OF 28

Item (62) WEEKLY  RATE

Item (63)  1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

Item (64)  6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

1/2 TON, EXTENDED CAB PICK-UP TRUCK - 4WD

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

ITEM   16....................Page  16  of  28



$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

99.97 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

549.97 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

2,497.97 0.00 1,395.00 0.08 nb nb 1,317.00 0.08 nb nb

2,397.97 0.00 1,240.00 0.08 nb nb 1,177.00 0.08 nb nb

BID  RESULTS                    
TENDER  852-2009

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

3/4 TON, EXTENDED CAB PICK-UP TRUCK - 2WD
Ranjoy Sales & 
Leasing Ltd. o/a 

Budget Car & Truck
P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

 Item (65) DAILY  RATE

Item (66) WEEKLY  RATE

Item (67)  1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

PAGE (17) OF 28

Item (68)  6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Legend    nb=no bid

ITEM   17....................Page  17  of  28



$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

99.97 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

549.97 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

2,497.97 0.00 1,410.00 0.08 nb nb 1,442.00 0.08 nb nb

2,397.97 0.00 1,300.00 0.08 nb nb 1,302.00 0.08 nb nb

Ranjoy Sales & 
Leasing Ltd. o/a 

Budget Car & Truck
P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

 Item (69) DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

BID  RESULTS                    
TENDER  852-2009

Legend    nb=no bid

PAGE (18) OF 28

Item (70) WEEKLY  RATE

Item (71)  1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

Item (72)  6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

3/4 TON, EXTENDED CAB PICK-UP TRUCK - 4WD

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

ITEM   18....................Page  18  of  28



$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

49.97 0.00 nb nb 45.00 0.08 nb nb 49.97 nb

279.97 0.00 nb nb 275.00 0.08 nb nb 319.97 nb

1,089.97 0.00 1,375.00 0.08 963.00 0.08 1,146.00 0.08 1,189.00 0.05

989.97 0.00 1,200.00 0.08 863.00 0.08 1,006.00 0.08 1,169.00 0.05

BID  RESULTS                    
TENDER  852-2009

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

1/2 TON, CREW CAB PICK-UP TRUCK - 2WD
Ranjoy Sales & 
Leasing Ltd. o/a 

Budget Car & Truck
P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

 Item (73) DAILY  RATE

Item (74) WEEKLY  RATE

Item (75)  1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

PAGE (19) OF 28

Item (76)  6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Legend    nb=no bid

ITEM   19....................Page  19  of  28



$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

49.97 0.00 nb nb 45.00 0.08 nb nb 49.97 nb

289.97 0.00 nb nb 275.00 0.08 nb nb 319.97 nb

1,089.97 0.00 1,290.00 0.08 963.00 0.08 1,294.00 0.08 1,189.00 0.05

989.97 0.00 1,160.00 0.08 863.00 0.08 1,154.00 0.08 1,169.00 0.05

Ranjoy Sales & 
Leasing Ltd. o/a 

Budget Car & Truck
P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

 Item (77) DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

BID  RESULTS                    
TENDER  852-2009

Legend    nb=no bid

PAGE (20) OF 28

Item (78) WEEKLY  RATE

Item (79)  1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

Item (80)  6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

1/2 TON, CREW CAB PICK-UP TRUCK - 4WD

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

ITEM   20....................Page  20  of  28



$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

99.97 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 109.99 0.00

549.97 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 629.99 0.00

2,497.97 0.00 1,595.00 0.08 nb nb 1,439.00 0.08 2,339.99 0.00

2,397.97 0.00 1,475.00 0.08 nb nb 1,299.00 0.08 2,319.99 0.00

BID  RESULTS                    
TENDER  852-2009

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

3/4 TON, CREW CAB PICK-UP TRUCK - 2WD
Ranjoy Sales & 
Leasing Ltd. o/a 

Budget Car & Truck
P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

 Item (81) DAILY  RATE

Item (82) WEEKLY  RATE

Item (83)  1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

PAGE (21) OF 28

Item (84)  6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Legend    nb=no bid
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$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

99.97 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 109.99 0.00
549.97 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 629.99 0.00

2,497.97 0.00 1,410.00 0.08 nb nb 1,493.00 0.08 2,339.99 0.00
2,397.97 0.00 1,300.00 0.08 nb nb 1,353.00 0.08 2,319.99 0.00
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Item (88)  6  MONTHS to less than 12  MO

Legend    nb=no bid

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

 Item (85) DAILY  RATE
Item (86) WEEKLY  RATE

Item (87)  1  MONTH to less than 6  MONT

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  852-2009 3/4 TON, CREW CAB PICK-UP TRUCK - 4WD

PRICES  SHOWN      Enterprise            The Driving Force Inc. Eastern Chrysler Calmont             Ranjoy Sales & 



$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km
nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb
nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

2,897.97 0.00 1,720.00 0.08 nb nb 1,723.00 0.08 nb nb
2,797.97 0.00 1,570.00 0.08 nb nb 1,583.00 0.08 nb nb
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Item (92)  6  MONTHS to less than 12  MO

Legend    nb=no bid

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T
 Item (89) DAILY  RATE
Item (90) WEEKLY  RATE

Item (91)  1  MONTH to less than 6  MONT

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  852-2009 1-TON, EXTENDED CAB PICK-UP TRUCK - 2WD

PRICES  SHOWN      Enterprise            The Driving Force Inc. Eastern Chrysler Calmont             Ranjoy Sales & 



$ Std  Ch $/km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

2,897.97 0.00 1,620.00 0.08 nb nb 1,624.00 0.08 nb nb

2,797.97 0.00 1,480.00 0.08 nb nb 1,484.00 0.08 nb nb

Ranjoy Sales & 
Leasing Ltd. o/a 

Budget Car & Truck
P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

 Item (93) DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

BID  RESULTS                    
TENDER  852-2009

Legend    nb=no bid

PAGE (24) OF 28

Item (94) WEEKLY  RATE

Item (95)  1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

Item (96)  6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

1-TON, EXTENDED CAB PICK-UP TRUCK - 4WD

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.
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$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb 1,370.00 0.08 nb nb 1,489.00 0.08 nb nb

nb nb 1,230.00 0.08 nb nb 1,232.00 0.08 nb nb

BID  RESULTS                    
TENDER  852-2009

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

1-TON, 2WD STAKE BODY TRUCK - REGULAR OR EXTENDED CAB
Ranjoy Sales & 
Leasing Ltd. o/a 

Budget Car & Truck
P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

 Item (97) DAILY  RATE

Item (98) WEEKLY  RATE

Item (99)  1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

PAGE (25) OF 28

Item (100)  6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Legend    nb=no bid
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$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb 1,430.00 0.08 nb nb 1,545.00 0.08 nb nb

nb nb 1,390.00 0.08 nb nb 1,392.00 0.08 nb nb

Legend    nb=no bid

PAGE (26) OF 28

Item (103)  1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

Item (104)  6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

 Item (101) DAILY  RATE

Item (102) WEEKLY  RATE

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

BID  RESULTS                    
TENDER  852-2009

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

1-TON, 2WD DUMP BODY TRUCK - REGULAR OR EXTENDED CAB
Ranjoy Sales & 
Leasing Ltd. o/a 

Budget Car & Truck

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.
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$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb 2,200.00 0.08 nb nb 2,250.00 0.08 nb nb

nb nb 2,070.00 0.08 nb nb 2,110.00 0.08 nb nb

BID  RESULTS                    
TENDER  852-2009

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

14,000# GVWR, 2WD DUMP BODY TRUCK - CREW CAB
Ranjoy Sales & 
Leasing Ltd. o/a 

Budget Car & Truck
P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

 Item (105) DAILY  RATE

Item (106) WEEKLY  RATE

Item (107)  1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

PAGE (27) OF 28

Item (108)  6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Legend    nb=no bid
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$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb 2,200.00 0.08 nb nb 2,250.00 0.08 nb nb

nb nb 2,070.00 0.08 nb nb 2,110.00 0.08 nb nb

Legend    nb=no bid

PAGE (28) OF 28

Item (111)  1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

Item (112)  6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

 Item (109) DAILY  RATE

Item (110) WEEKLY  RATE

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

BID  RESULTS                    
TENDER  852-2009

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

14,000# GVWR, 4WD DUMP BODY TRUCK - CREW CAB
Ranjoy Sales & 
Leasing Ltd. o/a 

Budget Car & Truck

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.
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