Bid Summary

COMPACT SIZED AUTOMOBILES

ITEM 1
NOTE PRICES SHOWN Enterprise The Drliv.ing Force Inc. |[Eastern Chrysler Dodgel Ca!mont National Car Rental
do not include Rent-A-Car (Driving Force). Jeep Leasing Ltd. (Canada) Inc.

! PST. or GST $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km [[$Std Ch $/km
DAILY RATE 32.87 0.00 nb nb 33.00 0.08 nb nb 37.00 nb
WEEKLY RATE 199.87 0.00 nb nb 190.00 0.08 nb nb 199.00 nb
1 MONTH to less than 6 MONTHS 724.87 0.00 890.00 0.10 690.00 0.08 nb nb 796.00 0.06

6 MONTHS to less than 12 MONTHS 624.87 0.00 725.00 0.10 625.00 0.08 nb nb 796.00 0.06
BID RESULTS
TENDER 781-2007
Page 1 of 29
LEASE of

VEHICLES for 2008
DAILY, WEEKLY and
MONTHLY

LEGEND

nb = no bid

Page 1 of 29




Bid Summary

MID SIZED AUTOMOBILES

ITEM 2
NOTE PRICES SHOWN Enterprise The Dr.iv.ing Force Inc. [[Eastern Chrysler Dodgel Ca!mont National Car Rental
do not include Rent-A-Car (Driving Force). Jeep Leasing Ltd. (Canada) Inc.

! PST. or GST $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km ||$Std Ch $/km
DAILY RATE 34.87 0.00 nb nb 34.00 0.08 nb nb 38.00 nb
WEEKLY RATE 209.87 0.00 nb nb 210.00 0.08 nb nb 214.50 nb

1 MONTH to less than 6 MONTHS 774.87 0.00 990.00 0.10 790.00 0.08 nb nb 858.00 0.08
6 MONTHS to less than 12 MONTHS 674.87 0.00 795.00 0.10 700.00 0.08 nb nb 858.00 0.08
BID RESULTS
TENDER 781-2007
Page 2 of 29
LEASE of

VEHICLES for 2008
DAILY, WEEKLY and
MONTHLY

LEGEND

nb = no bid

Page 2 of 29




Bid Summary

FULL SIZED AUTOMOBILES

ITEM 3
NOTE PRICES SHOWN Enterprise The Dr.iv.ing Force Inc. [[Eastern Chrysler Dodgel Ca!mont National Car Rental
do not include Rent-A-Car (Driving Force). Jeep Leasing Ltd. (Canada) Inc.

! PST. or GST $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km ||$Std Ch $/km
DAILY RATE 36.87 0.00 nb nb 37.00 0.08 nb nb 39.00 nb
WEEKLY RATE 224.87 0.00 nb nb 220.00 0.08 nb nb 228.50 nb

1 MONTH to less than 6 MONTHS 819.87 0.00 1,060.00 0.10 825.00 0.08 nb nb 914.00 0.08
6 MONTHS to less than 12 MONTHS 749.87 0.00 890.00 0.10 740.00 0.08 nb nb 914.00 0.08
BID RESULTS
TENDER 781-2007
Page 3 of 29
LEASE of

VEHICLES for 2008
DAILY, WEEKLY and
MONTHLY

LEGEND

nb = no bid

Page 3 of 29




Bid Summary

ITEM 4 MINI PASSENGER VANS
NOTE PRICES SHOWN Enterprise The Dr.iv.ing Force Inc. [[Eastern Chrysler Dodgel Ca!mont National Car Rental
do not include Rent-A-Car (Driving Force). Jeep Leasing Ltd. (Canada) Inc.

! PST. or GST $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km
DAILY RATE 44.87 0.00 nb nb 41.00 0.08 nb nb 48.00 nb
WEEKLY RATE 234.87 0.00 nb nb 240.00 0.08 nb nb 295.00 nb

1 MONTH to less than 6 MONTHS 849.87 0.00 1,100.00 0.10 875.00 0.08 nb nb 1,180.00 0.10
6 MONTHS to less than 12 MONTHS 749.87 0.00 950.00 0.10 805.00 0.08 nb nb 1,180.00 0.10
BID RESULTS
TENDER 781-2007
Page 4 of 29
LEASE of

VEHICLES for 2008
DAILY, WEEKLY and
MONTHLY

LEGEND

nb = no bid

Page 4 of 29




Bid Summary
ITEM 5

1/2 TON CARGO VANS

NOTE PRICES SHOWN Enterprise The Dr.iv.ing Force Inc. [[Eastern Chrysler Dodgel Ca!mont National Car Rental
do not include Rent-A-Car (Driving Force). Jeep Leasing Ltd. (Canada) Inc.

! PST. or GST $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km
DAILY RATE 48.87 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 39.00 nb
WEEKLY RATE 324.87 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 234.00 nb

1 MONTH to less than 6 MONTHS 888.87 0.00 920.00 0.10 nb nb 1,043.17 0.10 956.00 0.08
6 MONTHS to less than 12 MONTHS 788.87 0.00 820.00 0.10 nb nb 943.17 0.10 956.00 0.08
BID RESULTS
TENDER 781-2007
Page 5 of 29
LEASE of

VEHICLES for 2008
DAILY, WEEKLY and
MONTHLY

LEGEND

nb = no bid

Page 5 of 29




Bid Summary 8- PASSENGER VANS

ITEM 6
NOTE PRICES SHOWN Enterprise The Driving Force Inc. [[Eastern Chrysler Dodgel Calmont National Car Rental
do not include Rent-A-Car (Driving Force). Jeep Leasing Ltd. (Canada) Inc.
1
PST. or GST $Std Ch $/km $Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km
DAILY RATE nb nb nb nb 100.00 0.15 nb nb nb nb
WEEKLY RATE nb nb nb nb 675.00 0.15 nb nb nb nb
1 MONTH to less than 6 MONTHS nb nb nb nb 2,700.00 0.15 nb nb nb nb
6 MONTHS to less than 12 MONTHS nb nb nb nb 2,700.00 0.15 nb nb nb nb

BID RESULTS
TENDER 781-2007

Page 6 of 29

LEASE of
VEHICLES for 2008

DAILY, WEEKLY and

MONTHLY

LEGEND

nb = no bid

ITEM 6...cevennene. Page 6 of 29




Bid Summary 15- PASSENGER VAN

ITEM 7
NOTE PRICES SHOWN Enterprise The Dr.iv.ing Force Inc. [[Eastern Chrysler Dodgel Ca!mont National Car Rental
do not include Rent-A-Car (Driving Force). Jeep Leasing Ltd. (Canada) Inc.

! PST. or GST $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km
DAILY RATE nb nb nb nb 100.00 0.12 nb nb nb nb
WEEKLY RATE nb nb nb nb 675.00 0.12 nb nb nb nb

1 MONTH to less than 6 MONTHS nb nb 3,150.00 0.10 2,800.00 0.12 nb nb nb nb
6 MONTHS to less than 12 MONTHS nb nb 3,050.00 0.10 2,600.00 0.12 nb nb nb nb

BID RESULTS
TENDER 781-2007

Page 7 of 29

LEASE of
VEHICLES for 2008

DAILY, WEEKLY and

MONTHLY

LEGEND

nb = no bid

ITEM 7., Page 7 of 29




Bid Summary

MID SIZED SPORTS UTILITY VEHICLE - 4WD

ITEM 8
NOTE PRICES SHOWN Enterprise The Dr.iv.ing Force Inc. [[Eastern Chrysler Dodgel Ca!mont National Car Rental
do not include Rent-A-Car (Driving Force). Jeep Leasing Ltd. (Canada) Inc.

! PST. or GST $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km ||$Std Ch $/km
DAILY RATE 49.87 0.00 nb nb 47.00 0.08 nb nb 54.00 nb
WEEKLY RATE 299.87 0.00 nb nb 275.00 0.08 nb nb 319.00 nb

1 MONTH to less than 6 MONTHS 1,069.87 0.00 1,400.00 0.10 975.00 0.08 1,680.00 0.08 1,276.00 0.08
6 MONTHS to less than 12 MONTHS 969.87 0.00 1,250.00 0.10 925.00 0.08 1,533.96 0.08 1,276.00 0.08
BID RESULTS
TENDER 781-2007
Page 8 of 29
LEASE of

VEHICLES for 2008
DAILY, WEEKLY and
MONTHLY

LEGEND

nb = no bid

Page 8 of 29




Bid Summary FULL SIZED SPORTS UTILITY VEHICLE - 4WD

ITEM 9
NOTE PRICES SHOWN Enterprise The Dr.iv.ing Force Inc. [[Eastern Chrysler Dodgel Ca!mont National Car Rental
do not include Rent-A-Car (Driving Force). Jeep Leasing Ltd. (Canada) Inc.

! PST. or GST $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km
DAILY RATE 79.87 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 64.00 nb
WEEKLY RATE 499.87 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 359.00 nb

1 MONTH to less than 6 MONTHS 1,498.87 nb 1,500.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb 1,436.00 0.08
6 MONTHS to less than 12 MONTHS 1,398.87 nb 1,350.00 0.10 nb nb 1,633.85 0.10 1,436.00 0.08

BID RESULTS
TENDER 781-2007

Page 9 of 29

LEASE of
VEHICLES for 2008

DAILY, WEEKLY and

MONTHLY

LEGEND

nb = no bid

ITEM Q..o Page 9 of 29




Bid Summary 1/4 TON, EXTENDED CAB PICK-UP TRUCKS - 2WD

ITEM 10
NOTE PRICES SHOWN Enterprise The Dr.iv.ing Force Inc. [[Eastern Chrysler Dodgel Ca!mont National Car Rental
do not include Rent-A-Car (Driving Force). Jeep Leasing Ltd. (Canada) Inc.

! PST. or GST $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km ||$Std Ch $/km
DAILY RATE 37.87 0.00 nb nb 40.00 0.08 nb nb 39.00 nb
WEEKLY RATE 244.87 0.00 nb nb 245.00 0.08 nb nb 249.00 nb

1 MONTH to less than 6 MONTHS 898.87 0.00 nb nb 875.00 0.08 1,095.76 0.08 996.00 0.08
6 MONTHS to less than 12 MONTHS 798.87 0.00 nb nb 825.00 0.08 960.00 0.08 996.00 0.08

BID RESULTS
TENDER 781-2007

Page 10 of 29

LEASE of
VEHICLES for 2008

DAILY, WEEKLY and

MONTHLY

LEGEND

nb = no bid

ITEM 10..........cee.eee. Page 10 of 29




Bid Summary 1/4 TON, EXTENDED CAB PICK-UP TRUCKS - 4WD

ITEM 11
NOTE PRICES SHOWN Enterprise The Dr.iv.ing Force Inc. [[Eastern Chrysler Dodgel Ca!mont National Car Rental
do not include Rent-A-Car (Driving Force). Jeep Leasing Ltd. (Canada) Inc.

! PST. or GST $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km ||$Std Ch $/km
DAILY RATE 37.87 0.00 nb nb 40.00 0.08 nb nb 39.00 nb
WEEKLY RATE 244.87 0.00 nb nb 245.00 0.08 nb nb 249.00 nb

1 MONTH to less than 6 MONTHS 898.87 0.00 975.00 0.10 875.00 0.08 1,191.72 0.08 996.00 0.08
6 MONTHS to less than 12 MONTHS 798.87 0.00 889.00 0.10 825.00 0.08 1,054.53 0.08 996.00 0.08

BID RESULTS
TENDER 781-2007

Page 11 of 29

LEASE of
VEHICLES for 2008

DAILY, WEEKLY and

MONTHLY

LEGEND

nb = no bid

ITEM 11.................... Page 11 of 29




Bid Summary
ITEM 12

1/2 TON PICK-UP TRUCKS - 2WD

NOTE PRICES SHOWN Enterprise The Dr.iv.ing Force Inc. [[Eastern Chrysler Dodgel Ca!mont National Car Rental
do not include Rent-A-Car (Driving Force). Jeep Leasing Ltd. (Canada) Inc.

! PST. or GST $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km ||$Std Ch $/km
DAILY RATE 69,387.00 0.00 nb nb 43.00 0.08 nb nb 45.00 nb
WEEKLY RATE 447.87 0.00 nb nb 255.00 0.08 nb nb 270.00 nb

1 MONTH to less than 6 MONTHS 1,174.87 0.00 1,090.00 0.10 890.00 0.08 1,063.05 0.08 1,080.00 0.12
6 MONTHS to less than 12 MONTHS 1,074.87 0.00 950.00 0.10 800.00 0.08 930.25 0.08 1,080.00 0.12
BID RESULTS

TENDER 781-2007

Page 12 of 29

LEASE of
VEHICLES for 2008
DAILY, WEEKLY and
MONTHLY

LEGEND

nb = no bid

ITEM 12.........cc.cc

Page 12 of 29




Bid Summary 1/2 TON PICK-UP TRUCKS - 4WD

ITEM 13
NOTE PRICES SHOWN Enterprise The Dr.iv.ing Force Inc. [[Eastern Chrysler Dodgel Ca!mont National Car Rental
do not include Rent-A-Car (Driving Force). Jeep Leasing Ltd. (Canada) Inc.

! PST. or GST $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km ||$Std Ch $/km
DAILY RATE 69.87 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 45.00 nb
WEEKLY RATE 447.87 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 270.00 nb

1 MONTH to less than 6 MONTHS 1,174.87 0.00 990.00 0.10 nb nb 1,126.43 0.08 1,080.00 0.12
6 MONTHS to less than 12 MONTHS 1,074.87 0.00 890.00 0.10 nb nb 994.06 0.08 1,080.00 0.12

BID RESULTS
TENDER 781-20076

Page 13 of 29

LEASE of
VEHICLES for 2008

DAILY, WEEKLY and

MONTHLY

LEGEND

nb = no bid

ITEM 13.......cccceeeeeee. Page 13 of 29




Bid Summary
ITEM 14

3/4 TON PICK -UP TRUCKS -2WD

NOTE PRICES SHOWN Enterprise The Dr.iv.ing Force Inc. [[Eastern Chrysler Dodgel Ca!mont National Car Rental
do not include Rent-A-Car (Driving Force). Jeep Leasing Ltd. (Canada) Inc.

! PST. or GST $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km ||$Std Ch $/km
DAILY RATE 69.87 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 54.00 nb
WEEKLY RATE 447.87 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 325.00 nb

1 MONTH to less than 6 MONTHS 1,174.87 0.00 1,189.00 0.10 nb nb 1,214.00 0.08 1,300.00 0.12
6 MONTHS to less than 12 MONTHS 1,074.87 0.00 1,050.00 0.10 nb nb 1,079.00 0.08 1,300.00 0.12
BID RESULTS

TENDER 781-2007

Page 14 of 29

LEASE of
VEHICLES for 2008
DAILY, WEEKLY and
MONTHLY

LEGEND

nb = no bid

ITEM 14....................

Page 14 of 29




Bid Summary
ITEM 15

3/4 TON PICK -UP TRUCKS -4WD

NOTE PRICES SHOWN Enterprise The Dr.iv.ing Force Inc. [[Eastern Chrysler Dodgel Ca!mont National Car Rental
do not include Rent-A-Car (Driving Force). Jeep Leasing Ltd. (Canada) Inc.

! PST. or GST $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km ||$Std Ch $/km
DAILY RATE 69.87 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 54.00 nb
WEEKLY RATE 447.87 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 325.00 nb

1 MONTH to less than 6 MONTHS 1,174.87 0.00 1,189.00 0.10 nb nb 1,343.00 0.08 1,300.00 0.12
6 MONTHS to less than 12 MONTHS 1,074.87 0.05 1,050.00 0.10 nb nb 1,204.00 0.08 1,300.00 0.12
BID RESULTS

TENDER 781-2007

Page 15 of 29

LEASE of
VEHICLES for 2008
DAILY, WEEKLY and
MONTHLY

LEGEND

nb = no bid

ITEM 15.........cceeee

Page 15 of 29




Bid Summary
ITEM 16

1/2 TON, EXTENDED CAB PICK - UP TRUCKS -2WD

NOTE PRICES SHOWN Enterprise The Dr.iv.ing Force Inc. [[Eastern Chrysler Dodgel Ca!mont National Car Rental
do not include Rent-A-Car (Driving Force). Jeep Leasing Ltd. (Canada) Inc.

! PST. or GST $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km ||$Std Ch $/km
DAILY RATE 49.87 0.00 nb nb 41.00 0.08 nb nb 45.00 nb
WEEKLY RATE 298.87 0.00 nb nb 250.00 0.08 nb nb 280.00 nb

1 MONTH to less than 6 MONTHS 1,034.87 0.00 1,050.00 0.10 885.00 0.08 1,250.85 0.10 1,120.00 0.12
6 MONTHS to less than 12 MONTHS 934.87 0.00 950.00 0.10 800.00 0.08 1,052.85 0.10 1,120.00 0.12
BID RESULTS

TENDER 781-2007

Page 16 of 29

LEASE of
VEHICLES for 2008
DAILY, WEEKLY and
MONTHLY

LEGEND

nb = no bid

ITEM 16......cccceee

Page 16 of 29




Bid Summary
ITEM 17

1/2 TON, EXTENDED CAB PICK - UP TRUCKS - 4WD

NOTE PRICES SHOWN Enterprise The Dr.iv.ing Force Inc. [[Eastern Chrysler Dodgel Ca!mont National Car Rental
do not include Rent-A-Car (Driving Force). Jeep Leasing Ltd. (Canada) Inc.

! PST. or GST $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km ||$Std Ch $/km
DAILY RATE 49.87 0.00 nb nb 44.00 0.08 nb nb 45.00 nb
WEEKLY RATE 298.87 0.00 nb nb 260.00 0.08 nb nb 280.00 nb

1 MONTH to less than 6 MONTHS 1,034.87 0.00 985.00 0.10 900.00 0.08 1,246.00 0.08 1,120.00 0.12
6 MONTHS to less than 12 MONTHS 934.87 0.00 889.00 0.10 800.00 0.08 106.00 0.08 1,120.00 0.12
BID RESULTS

TENDER 781-2007

Page 17 of 29

LEASE of
VEHICLES for 2008
DAILY, WEEKLY and
MONTHLY

LEGEND

nb = no bid

ITEM 17.....cccceiiees

Page 17 of 29




Bid Summary
ITEM 18

3/4 TON, EXTENDED CAB PICK - UP TRUCKS - 2WD

NOTE PRICES SHOWN Enterprise The Dr.iv.ing Force Inc. [[Eastern Chrysler Dodgel Ca!mont National Car Rental
do not include Rent-A-Car (Driving Force). Jeep Leasing Ltd. (Canada) Inc.

! PST. or GST $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km ||$Std Ch $/km
DAILY RATE 69.87 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 54.00 nb
WEEKLY RATE 447.87 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 325.00 nb

1 MONTH to less than 6 MONTHS 1,174.87 0.00 1,189.00 0.10 nb nb 1,317.00 0.08 1,300.00 0.12
6 MONTHS to less than 12 MONTHS 1,074.87 0.05 1,050.00 0.10 nb nb 1,177.00 0.08 1,300.00 0.12
BID RESULTS

TENDER 781-2007

Page 18 of 29

LEASE of
VEHICLES for 2008
DAILY, WEEKLY and
MONTHLY

LEGEND

nb = no bid

ITEM 18......ccccceee

Page 18 of 29




Bid Summary
ITEM 19

3/4 TON, EXTENDED CAB PICK - UP TRUCKS -4WD

NOTE PRICES SHOWN Enterprise The Dr.iv.ing Force Inc. [[Eastern Chrysler Dodgel Ca!mont National Car Rental
do not include Rent-A-Car (Driving Force). Jeep Leasing Ltd. (Canada) Inc.

! PST. or GST $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km ||$Std Ch $/km
DAILY RATE 69.87 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 54.00 nb
WEEKLY RATE 447.87 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 325.00 nb

1 MONTH to less than 6 MONTHS 1,174.87 0.00 1,189.00 0.10 nb nb 1,442.00 0.08 1,300.00 0.12
6 MONTHS to less than 12 MONTHS 1,074.87 0.00 1,050.00 0.10 nb nb 1,302.00 0.08 1,300.00 0.12
BID RESULTS

TENDER 781-2007

Page 19 of 29

LEASE of
VEHICLES for 2008
DAILY, WEEKLY and
MONTHLY

LEGEND

nb = no bid

ITEM 19............ccce.

Page 19 of 29




Bid Summary

1/2-TON CREW CAB PICK - UP TRUCKS -2WD

ITEM 20
NOTE PRICES SHOWN Enterprise The Dr.iv.ing Force Inc. [[Eastern Chrysler Dodgel Ca!mont National Car Rental
do not include Rent-A-Car (Driving Force). Jeep Leasing Ltd. (Canada) Inc.

! PST. or GST $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km
DAILY RATE 49.87 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 60.00 nb
WEEKLY RATE 298.87 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 360.00 nb

1 MONTH to less than 6 MONTHS 1,034.87 0.00 1,150.00 0.10 nb nb 146.00 0.08 1,440.00 0.15
6 MONTHS to less than 12 MONTHS 934.87 0.00 990.00 0.10 nb nb 1,006.00 0.08 1,440.00 0.15
BID RESULTS

TENDER 781-2007

Page 20 of 29

LEASE of
VEHICLES for 2007
DAILY, WEEKLY and
MONTHLY

LEGEND

nb = no bid

ITEM 20................

Page 20 of 29




Bid Summary 1/2-TON CREW CAB PICK - UP TRUCKS - 4WD

ITEM 21
NOTE PRICES SHOWN Enterprise The Dr.iv.ing Force Inc. [[Eastern Chrysler Dodgel Ca!mont National Car Rental
do not include Rent-A-Car (Driving Force). Jeep Leasing Ltd. (Canada) Inc.

! PST. or GST $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km
DAILY RATE 49.87 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 60.00 nb
WEEKLY RATE 298.87 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 360.00 nb

1 MONTH to less than 6 MONTHS 1,034.87 0.00 985.00 0.10 nb nb 1,294.00 0.08 1,440.00 0.15
6 MONTHS to less than 12 MONTHS 934.87 0.00 889.00 0.10 nb nb 1,154.00 0.08 1,440.00 0.15

BID RESULTS
TENDER 781-2007

Page 21 of 29

LEASE of
VEHICLES for 2008

DAILY, WEEKLY and

MONTHLY

LEGEND

nb = no bid

ITEM 21.................... Page 21 of 29




Bid Summary

3/4-TON CREW CAB PICK - UP TRUCKS - 2WD

ITEM 22
NOTE PRICES SHOWN Enterprise The Driving Force Inc. Eastern Chrysler Calmont National Car Rental
1
PST. or GST ([$Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km
DAILY RATE 69.87 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 54.00 nb
WEEKLY RATE 447.87 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 325.00 nb
1 MONTH to less than 6 MONTHS 1,174.87 0.00 1,390.00 0.10 nb nb 1,373.00 0.08 1,300.00 0.12
6 MONTHS to less than 12 MONTHS 1,074.87 0.00 1,100.00 0.10 nb nb 1,233.00 0.08 1,300.00 0.12
BID RESULTS
Page 22 of 29
LEASE of

VEHICLES for 2008
DAILY, WEEKLY and
MONTHLY

LEGEND
nb = no bid

ITEM22 ..o, PAGE 22 of 29




Bid Summary

3/4-TON CREW CAB PICK - UP TRUCKS -4WD

ITEM 23
NOTE PRICES SHOWN Enterprise The Driving Force Inc. Eastern Chrysler Calmont National Car Rental
1 PST. or G.ST | $Std Ch $/km_|[$Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km
DAILY RATE 69.87 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 54.00 nb
WEEKLY RATE 447.87 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 325.00 nb
1 MONTH to less than6 MONTHS 1,174.87 0.00 1,390.00 0.10 nb nb 1,493.00 0.08 1,300.00 0.12
6 MONTHS to less than12 MONTHS 1,074.87 0.00 1,100.00 0.10 nb nb 1,353.00 0.08 1,300.00 0.12
BID RESULTS
Page 23 of 29
LEASE of

VEHICLES for 2008
DAILY, WEEKLY and
MONTHLY

LEGEND
nb = no bid

ITEM 23 .....

PAGE 23 OF 29




Bid Summary 1 TON, EXTENDED CAB PICK - UP TRUCKS - 2WD

ITEM 24
NOTE PRICES SHOWN Enterprise The Dr.iv.ing Force Inc. [[Eastern Chrysler Dodgel Ca!mont National Car Rental
do not include Rent-A-Car (Driving Force). Jeep Leasing Ltd. (Canada) Inc.

! PST. or GST $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km
DAILY RATE nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 65.00 nb
WEEKLY RATE nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 375.00 nb

1 MONTH to less than 6 MONTHS 1,347.87 nb 1,400.00 0.10 nb nb 1,723.00 0.08 1,500.00 0.15
6 MONTHS to less than 12 MONTHS 1,247.87 nb 1,300.00 0.10 nb nb 1,583.00 0.08 1,500.00 0.15

BID RESULTS
TENDER 781-2007

Page 24 of 29

LEASE of
VEHICLES for 2008

DAILY, WEEKLY and

MONTHLY

LEGEND

nb = no bid

ITEM 24.................. Page 24 of 29




Bid Summary 1 TON, EXTENDED CAB PICK - UP TRUCKS - 4WD

ITEM 25
NOTE PRICES SHOWN Enterprise The Dr.iv.ing Force Inc. [[Eastern Chrysler Dodgel Ca!mont National Car Rental
do not include Rent-A-Car (Driving Force). Jeep Leasing Ltd. (Canada) Inc.

! PST. or GST $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km
DAILY RATE nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 65.00 nb
WEEKLY RATE nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 375.00 nb

1 MONTH to less than 6 MONTHS 1,347.87 nb 1,400.00 0.10 nb nb 1,724.00 0.08 1,500.00 0.15
6 MONTHS to less than 12 MONTHS 1,247.87 nb 1,300.00 0.10 nb nb 1,584.00 0.08 1,500.00 0.15

BID RESULTS
TENDER 781-2007

Page 25 of 29

LEASE of
VEHICLES for 2008

DAILY, WEEKLY and

MONTHLY

LEGEND

nb = no bid

ITEM 25....cciiennenien. Page 25 of 29




Bid Summary

1 TON, 2WD STAKE BODY TRUCKS - REGULAR OR EXTENDED CAB

ITEM 26
NOTE PRICES SHOWN Enterprise The Dr.iv.ing Force Inc. [[Eastern Chrysler Dodgel Ca!mont National Car Rental
do not include Rent-A-Car (Driving Force). Jeep Leasing Ltd. (Canada) Inc.

! PST. or GST $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km
DAILY RATE nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb
WEEKLY RATE nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

1 MONTH to less than 6 MONTHS nb nb 1,280.00 0.10 nb nb 1,572.00 0.08 nb nb
6 MONTHS to less than 12 MONTHS nb nb 1,100.00 0.10 nb nb 1,432.00 0.08 nb nb
BID RESULTS

TENDER 781-2007

Page 26 of 29

LEASE of
VEHICLES for 2008

DAILY, WEEKLY and

MONTHLY

LEGEND

nb = no bid

ITEM 26.....ccccuenen... Page 26 of 29




Bid Summary

1 TON, 2WD DUMP BODY TRUCKS - REGULAR OR EXTENDED

ITEM 27
NOTE PRICES SHOWN Enterprise The Dr.iv.ing Force Inc. [[Eastern Chrysler Dodgel Ca!mont National Car Rental
do not include Rent-A-Car (Driving Force). Jeep Leasing Ltd. (Canada) Inc.

! PST. or GST $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km
DAILY RATE nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb
WEEKLY RATE nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

1 MONTH to less than 6 MONTHS nb nb 1,350.00 0.10 nb nb 1,732.00 0.08 nb nb
6 MONTHS to less than 12 MONTHS nb nb 1,280.00 0.10 nb nb 1,592.00 0.08 nb nb
BID RESULTS

TENDER 781-2007

Page 27 of 97

LEASE of
VEHICLES for 2008

DAILY, WEEKLY and

MONTHLY

LEGEND

nb = no bid

ITEM 27..cccvvniannnn.n. Page 27 of 29




Bid Summary

14, 000# GVWR, 2WD DUMP BODY TRUCKS - CREW CAB

ITEM 28
NOTE PRICES SHOWN Enterprise The Dr.iv.ing Force Inc. [[Eastern Chrysler Dodgel Ca!mont National Car Rental
do not include Rent-A-Car (Driving Force). Jeep Leasing Ltd. (Canada) Inc.

! PST. or GST $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km
DAILY RATE nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb
WEEKLY RATE nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

1 MONTH to less than 6 MONTHS nb nb 2,390.00 0.10 nb nb 2,068.56 0.08 nb nb
6 MONTHS to less than 12 MONTHS nb nb 2,240.00 0.10 nb nb 1,928.56 0.08 nb nb
BID RESULTS

TENDER 781-2007

Page 29 of 28

LEASE of
VEHICLES for 2008

DAILY, WEEKLY and

MONTHLY

LEGEND

nb = no bid

ITEM 28.....ccceeeeneenee. Page 28 of 29




Bid Summary

14, 000# GVWR, 4WD DUMP BODY TRUCKS - CREW CAB

ITEM 29
NOTE PRICES SHOWN Enterprise The Dr.iv.ing Force Inc. [[Eastern Chrysler Dodgel Ca!mont National Car Rental
do not include Rent-A-Car (Driving Force). Jeep Leasing Ltd. (Canada) Inc.

! PST. or GST $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km $ Std Ch $/km
DAILY RATE nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb
WEEKLY RATE nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

1 MONTH to less than 6 MONTHS nb nb 2,390.00 0.10 nb nb 2,246.32 0.08 nb nb
6 MONTHS to less than 12 MONTHS nb nb 2,240.00 0.10 nb nb 2,106.32 0.08 nb nb
BID RESULTS

TENDER 781-2007

Page 29 of 29

LEASE of
VEHICLES for 2008

DAILY, WEEKLY and

MONTHLY

LEGEND

nb = no bid

ITEM 29......cccceeeene. Page 29 of 29






