
NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

34.38 0.00 34.00 0.10 30.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

206.38 0.00 185.00 0.10 190.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

699.38 0.00 795.00 0.10 700.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

599.38 0.00 675.00 0.10 670.00 0.08 nb nb 717.38 0.12

$ Std  Ch $ / km

35.00 0.00

199.99 0.00

769.99 0.06

769.99 0.06

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  745-2005 

Page  1  of  28

nb = no bid

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

National              
Car Rental

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Bid Summary         
ITEM  1

PRICES  SHOWN              
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

LEGEND

LEASE of            
VEHICLES for 2006    

DAILY, WEEKLY  and  
MONTHLY

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

COMPACT  SIZED  AUTOMOBILES

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

ITEM   1....................Page  1  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

35.38 0.00 36.00 0.10 35.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

212.38 0.00 234.00 0.10 225.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

779.38 0.00 875.00 0.10 800.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

679.38 0.00 775.00 0.10 750.00 0.08 nb nb 761.25 0.12

$ Std  Ch $ / km

37.00 0.00

214.50 0.00

824.50 0.08

824.50 0.08

LEGEND

nb = no bid

Page  2  of  28

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE
LEASE of            

VEHICLES for 2006    
DAILY, WEEKLY  and  

MONTHLY
 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  745-2005

National              
Car Rental

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

MID  SIZED  AUTOMOBILES

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

Bid Summary         
ITEM  2

ITEM   2....................Page  2  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

38.38 0.00 43.00 0.10 37.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

230.38 0.00 260.00 0.10 240.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

859.38 0.00 925.00 0.10 900.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

759.38 0.00 860.00 0.10 850.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

$ Std  Ch $ / km

39.00 0.00

228.50 0.00

840.00 0.08

840.00 0.08

Bid Summary         
ITEM  3

WEEKLY  RATE

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  745-2005

LEGEND

LEASE of            
VEHICLES for 2006    

DAILY, WEEKLY  and  
MONTHLY

nb = no bid

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Page  3  of  28

National              
Car Rental

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

FULL  SIZED  AUTOMOBILES

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

ITEM   3....................Page  3  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb 920.00 0.10 nb nb 1,070.30 0.00 nb nb

nb nb 780.00 0.10 nb nb 876.46 0.00 1,204.47 0.12

$ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb

nb nb

nb nb

nb nb

Bid Summary         
ITEM  4

WEEKLY  RATE

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  745-2005

LEGEND

LEASE of            
VEHICLES for 2005    

DAILY, WEEKLY  and  
MONTHLY

nb = no bid

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Page  4 of  24

National              
Car Rental

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

MINI  CARGO  VANS

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

ITEM   4....................Page  4  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

40.38 0.00 48.00 0.10 47.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

242.38 0.00 270.00 0.10 260.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

899.38 0.00 980.00 0.10 850.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

799.38 0.00 875.00 0.10 825.00 0.08 nb nb 710.45 0.12

$ Std  Ch $ / km

48.00 0.00

295.00 0.00

1,100.00 0.10

1,100.00 0.10

Bid Summary         
ITEM  5

WEEKLY  RATE

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  745-2005 

LEGEND

LEASE of            
VEHICLES for 2006    

DAILY, WEEKLY  and  
MONTHLY

nb = no bid

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Page  5  of  24

National              
Car Rental

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

MINI  PASSENGER  VANS

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

ITEM   5....................Page  5  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

39.38 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

236.38 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

774.38 0.00 790.00 0.10 nb nb 1,085.22 0.00 nb nb

674.38 0.00 715.00 0.10 nb nb 872.90 0.00 822.05 0.12

$ Std  Ch $ / km

39.00 0.00

234.00 0.00

960.00 0.08

890.00 0.08

Bid Summary         
ITEM  6

WEEKLY  RATE

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  745-2005

LEGEND

LEASE of            
VEHICLES for 2006    

DAILY, WEEKLY  and  
MONTHLY

nb = no bid

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Page  6  of  28

National              
Car Rental

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

1/2   TON  CARGO  VANS

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

ITEM   6....................Page  6  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 881.06 0.12

$ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb

nb nb

nb nb

nb nb

Bid Summary         
ITEM  7

WEEKLY  RATE

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  745-2005 

LEGEND

LEASE of            
VEHICLES for 2006    

DAILY, WEEKLY  and  
MONTHLY

nb = no bid

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Page  7  of  28

National              
Car Rental

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

1/2   TON  PASSENGER  VANS

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

ITEM   7....................Page  7  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb 2,875.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb 2,800.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb 1,032.87 0.12

$ Std  Ch $ / km

92.50 0.15

550.00 0.15

1,975.00 0.15

1,975.00 0.15

LEGEND

nb = no bid

Page  8  of  28

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE
LEASE of            

VEHICLES for 2006    
DAILY, WEEKLY  and  

MONTHLY
 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  745-2005

National              
Car Rental

3/4   TON  PASSENGER  VANSBid Summary         
ITEM  8

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

ITEM   8....................Page  8  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

44.38 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

266.38 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

998.38 0.00 1,300.00 0.10 nb nb 1,559.07 0.00 nb nb

898.38 0.00 1,150.00 0.10 nb nb 1,266.50 0.00 1,196.95 0.12

$ Std  Ch $ / km

54.00 0.00

319.00 0.00

1,175.00 0.08

1,100.00 0.08

Bid Summary         
ITEM  9

WEEKLY  RATE

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  745-2005

LEGEND

LEASE of            
VEHICLES for 2006    

DAILY, WEEKLY  and  
MONTHLY

nb = no bid

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Page  9  of  28

National              
Car Rental

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

MID SIZED SPORTS UTILITY VEHICLE - 4WD

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

ITEM   9....................Page  9  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

61.38 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

368.38 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

1,394.38 nb 1,600.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb nb nb

1,284.38 nb 1,450.00 0.10 nb nb 1,639.52 0.00 nb nb

$ Std  Ch $ / km

64.00 0.00

359.00 0.00

1,350.00 0.08

1,350.00 0.08

LEGEND

nb = no bid

Page  10  of  28

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE
LEASE of            

VEHICLES for 2006    
DAILY, WEEKLY  and  

MONTHLY
 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  745-2005

National              
Car Rental

FULL SIZED SPORTS UTILITY VEHICLE - 4WDBid Summary         
ITEM  10

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

ITEM   10....................Page  10  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

41.38 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

248.38 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

898.38 0.00 nb nb nb nb 985.08 0.00 nb nb

798.38 0.00 nb nb nb nb 785.74 0.00 667.16 0.12

$ Std  Ch $ / km

39.00 0.00

239.00 0.00

960.00 0.08

890.00 0.08

Bid Summary         
ITEM  11

WEEKLY  RATE

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  745-2005

LEGEND

LEASE of            
VEHICLES for 2006    

DAILY, WEEKLY  and  
MONTHLY

nb = no bid

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Page  11  of  28

National              
Car Rental

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

1/4 TON, EXTENDED CAB PICK-UP TRUCKS - 2WD

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

ITEM   11....................Page  11  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

41.38 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

248.38 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

898.38 0.00 980.00 0.10 nb nb 1,107.48 0.00 nb nb

798.38 0.00 870.00 0.10 nb nb 888.20 0.00 844.55 0.12

$ Std  Ch $ / km

39.00 0.00

239.00 0.00

960.00 0.08

889.00 0.08

LEGEND

nb = no bid

Page  12  of  28

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE
LEASE of            

VEHICLES for 2006    
DAILY, WEEKLY  and  

MONTHLY
 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  745-2005 

National              
Car Rental

1/4 TON, EXTENDED CAB PICK-UP TRUCKS - 4WDBid Summary         
ITEM  12

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

ITEM   12....................Page  12  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

42.38 0.00 44.00 0.10 45.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

254.38 0.00 260.00 0.10 250.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

919.38 0.00 900.00 0.10 850.00 0.08 1,087.08 0.00 nb nb

819.38 0.00 850.00 0.10 825.00 0.08 871.12 0.00 609.12 0.12

$ Std  Ch $ / km

45.00 0.00

270.00 0.00

1,100.00 0.12

1,100.00 0.12

Bid Summary         
ITEM  13

WEEKLY  RATE

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  745-2005

LEGEND

LEASE of            
VEHICLES for 2006    

DAILY, WEEKLY  and  
MONTHLY

nb = no bid

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Page  13  of  28

National              
Car Rental

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

1/2 TON PICK-UP TRUCKS - 2WD

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

ITEM   13....................Page  13  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

42.38 0.00 48.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb nb nb

254.38 0.00 280.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb nb nb

919.38 0.00 920.00 0.10 nb nb 1,189.09 0.00 nb nb

819.38 0.00 850.00 0.10 nb nb 1,014.17 0.00 647.11 0.12

$ Std  Ch $ / km

45.00 0.00

270.00 0.00

1,100.00 0.12

1,100.00 0.12

LEGEND

nb = no bid

Page  14  of  28

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE
LEASE of            

VEHICLES for 2006    
DAILY, WEEKLY  and  

MONTHLY
 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  745-2005

National              
Car Rental

1/2 TON PICK-UP TRUCKS - 4WDBid Summary         
ITEM  14

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

ITEM   14....................Page  14  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

49.38 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

296.38 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

1,074.38 0.00 1,035.00 0.10 nb nb 1,189.09 0.00 nb nb

974.38 0.00 915.00 0.10 nb nb 956.50 0.00 897.82 0.12

$ Std  Ch $ / km

54.00 0.00

325.00 0.00

1,250.00 0.12

1,200.00 0.12

Bid Summary         
ITEM  15

WEEKLY  RATE

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  745-2005

LEGEND

LEASE of            
VEHICLES for 2006    

DAILY, WEEKLY  and  
MONTHLY

nb = no bid

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Page  15  of  28

National              
Car Rental

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

3/4   TON   PICK - UP   TRUCKS  - 2WD

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

ITEM   15....................Page  15  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

49.38 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

296.38 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

1,074.38 0.00 1,035.00 0.10 nb nb 1,331.89 0.00 nb nb

974.38 0.05 915.00 0.10 nb nb 1,076.03 0.00 793.62 0.12

$ Std  Ch $ / km

54.00 0.00

325.00 0.00

1,200.00 0.12

1,200.00 0.12

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  745-2005

National              
Car Rental

LEGEND

nb = no bid

Page  16  of  28

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE
LEASE of            

VEHICLES for 2006    
DAILY, WEEKLY  and  

MONTHLY
 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

3/4   TON   PICK - UP   TRUCKS  - 4WD

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

Bid Summary         
ITEM  16

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

ITEM   16....................Page  16  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

43.38 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

260.38 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

989.38 0.00 950.00 0.10 nb nb 1,270.69 0.00 nb nb

889.38 0.00 850.00 0.10 nb nb 1,024.80 0.00 763.20 0.12

$ Std  Ch $ / km

45.00 0.00

280.00 0.00

1,100.00 0.12

1,100.00 0.12

WEEKLY  RATE

Bid Summary         
ITEM  17

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

DAILY  RATE

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  745-2005

Page  17  of  28

National              
Car Rental

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

1/2   TON, EXTENDED CAB  PICK - UP TRUCKS  - 2WD

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

nb = no bid

LEGEND

LEASE of            
VEHICLES for 2006    

DAILY, WEEKLY  and  
MONTHLY

ITEM   17....................Page  17  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

43.38 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

260.38 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

989.38 0.00 950.00 0.10 nb nb 1,454.00 0.00 nb nb

889.38 0.00 850.00 0.10 nb nb 1,178.48 0.00 614.45 0.12

$ Std  Ch $ / km

45.00 0.00

280.00 0.00

1,100.00 0.12

1,100.00 0.12

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  745-2005

National              
Car Rental

LEGEND

nb = no bid

Page  18  of  28

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE
LEASE of            

VEHICLES for 2006    
DAILY, WEEKLY  and  

MONTHLY
 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

1/2   TON, EXTENDED CAB  PICK - UP TRUCKS - 4WD

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

Bid Summary         
ITEM  18

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

ITEM   18....................Page  18  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

49.38 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

296.38 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

1,074.38 0.00 1,035.00 0.10 nb nb 1,173.00 0.00 nb nb

974.38 0.05 955.00 0.10 nb nb 958.17 0.00 808.24 0.12

808.24 0.12

$ Std  Ch $ / km

54.00 0.00

325.00 0.00

1,200.00 0.12

1,200.00 0.12

WEEKLY  RATE

Bid Summary         
ITEM  19

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

DAILY  RATE

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  745-2005

Page  19  of  28

National              
Car Rental

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

3/4  TON, EXTENDED CAB  PICK - UP TRUCKS  - 2WD

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

nb = no bid

LEGEND

LEASE of            
VEHICLES for 2006    

DAILY, WEEKLY  and  
MONTHLY

ITEM   19....................Page  19  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

49.38 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

296.38 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

1,074.38 0.00 1,035.00 0.10 nb nb 1,479.10 0.00 nb nb

974.38 0.00 955.00 0.10 nb nb 1,214.30 0.00 657.28 0.12

$ Std  Ch $ / km

54.00 0.00

325.00 0.00

1,200.00 0.12

1,200.00 0.12

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  745-2005

National              
Car Rental

LEGEND

nb = no bid

Page  20  of  28

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE
LEASE of            

VEHICLES for 2006    
DAILY, WEEKLY  and  

MONTHLY
 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

3/4  TON, EXTENDED CAB  PICK - UP TRUCKS  - 4WD

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

Bid Summary         
ITEM  20

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

ITEM   20....................Page  20  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

49.38 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

296.38 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

1,074.38 0.00 1,280.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb nb nb

974.38 0.00 1,100.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb 1,357.48 0.12

$ Std  Ch $ / km

60.00 0.00

360.00 0.00

1,350.00 0.15

1,350.00 0.15

WEEKLY  RATE

Bid Summary         
ITEM  21

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

DAILY  RATE

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  745-2005

Page  21  of  28

National              
Car Rental

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

CREW CAB  PICK - UP TRUCKS  - 2WD

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

nb = no bid

LEGEND

LEASE of            
VEHICLES for 2006    

DAILY, WEEKLY  and  
MONTHLY

ITEM   21....................Page  21  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

49.38 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

296.38 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

1,074.38 0.00 1,280.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb nb nb

974.38 0.00 1,100.00 0.10 nb nb 1,485.06 0.00 867.46 0.12

$ Std  Ch $ / km

60.00 0.00

360.00 0.00

1,350.00 0.15

1,350.00 0.15

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  745-2005 

National              
Car Rental

LEGEND

nb = no bid

Page  22  of  28

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE
LEASE of            

VEHICLES for 2006    
DAILY, WEEKLY  and  

MONTHLY
 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

CREW CAB  PICK - UP TRUCKS  - 4WD

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

Bid Summary         
ITEM  22

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

ITEM   22....................Page  22  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb 1,380.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb 1,200.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb 932.50 0.12

$ Std  Ch $ / km

65.00 0.00

375.00 0.00

1,350.00 0.15

1,350.00 0.15

WEEKLY  RATE

Bid Summary         
ITEM  23

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

DAILY  RATE

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  745-2005

Page  23  of  28

National              
Car Rental

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

1 TON, EXTENDED CAB  PICK - UP TRUCKS  - 2WD  -  DRW

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

nb = no bid

LEGEND

LEASE of            
VEHICLES for 2006    

DAILY, WEEKLY  and  
MONTHLY

ITEM   23....................Page  23  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb 1,380.00 0.10 nb nb 1,583.11 0.00 nb nb

nb nb 1,200.00 0.10 nb nb 1,325.06 0.00 868.77 0.12

$ Std  Ch $ / km

65.00 0.00

375.00 0.00

1,350.00 0.15

1,350.00 0.15

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  745-2005 

National              
Car Rental

LEGEND

nb = no bid

Page  24  of  28

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE
LEASE of            

VEHICLES for 2006    
DAILY, WEEKLY  and  

MONTHLY
 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

1 TON, EXTENDED CAB  PICK - UP TRUCKS  - 4WD  -  DRW

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

Bid Summary         
ITEM  24

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

ITEM   24....................Page  24  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb 1,250.00 0.10 nb nb 1,499.50 0.00 nb nb

nb nb 1,090.00 0.10 nb nb 1,231.38 0.00 nb nb

$ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb

nb nb

nb nb

nb nb

Bid Summary         
ITEM  25

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

1 TON, 2WD STAKE BODY TRUCKS  - REGULAR OR EXTENDED

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

LEGEND

LEASE of            
VEHICLES for 2006    

DAILY, WEEKLY  and  
MONTHLY

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  745-2005

National              
Car Rental

nb = no bid

Page  25  of  28

ITEM   25....................Page  25  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb 1,350.00 0.10 nb nb 1,675.31 0.00 nb nb

nb nb 1,250.00 0.10 nb nb 1,436.28 0.00 nb nb

$ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb

nb nb

nb nb

nb nb

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  745-2005

National              
Car Rental

LEGEND

nb = no bid

Page  26  of  28

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE
LEASE of            

VEHICLES for 2006    
DAILY, WEEKLY  and  

MONTHLY
 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

1 TON, 2WD DUMP BODY TRUCKS  - REGULAR OR EXTENDED

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

Bid Summary         
ITEM  26

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

ITEM   26....................Page  26  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 2,076.53 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 1,743.64 0.00 nb nb

$ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb

nb nb

nb nb

nb nb

Bid Summary         
ITEM  27

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

14, 000# GVWR, 2WD DUMP BODY TRUCKS  - CREW CAB

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

LEGEND

LEASE of            
VEHICLES for 2006    

DAILY, WEEKLY  and  
MONTHLY

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  745-2005

National              
Car Rental

nb = no bid

Page  27  of  28

ITEM   27....................Page  27  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 2,149.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 1,820.00 0.00 nb nb

$ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb

nb nb

nb nb

nb nb

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  745-2006 

National              
Car Rental

LEGEND

nb = no bid

Page  28  of  28

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE
LEASE of            

VEHICLES for 2006    
DAILY, WEEKLY  and  

MONTHLY
 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

Eastern Chrysler Dodge 
Jeep

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

14, 000# GVWR, 4WD DUMP BODY TRUCKS  - CREW CAB

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

Bid Summary         
ITEM  28

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

ITEM   28....................Page  28  of  28


