
NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

34.47 0.00 nb nb 34.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb

189.47 0.00 nb nb 184.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb

624.47 0.00 nb nb 795.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb

505.47 0.00 nb nb 645.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb

505.47 0.10 nb nb nb nb 421.00 0.00 nb nb

505.47 0.10 254.65 0.10 nb nb 372.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 369.00 0.00 nb nb

505.47 0.10 nb nb nb nb 310.00 0.00 nb nb

$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

35.00 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb

199.00 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb

789.00 0.06 550.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb

769.00 0.06 550.00 0.10 613.00 0.08 nb nb

769.00 0.06 nb nb 341.00 0.08 nb nb

759.00 0.06 296.00 0.10 321.00 0.08 418.01 0.11

769.00 0.06 nb nb 309.00 0.08 nb nb

759.00 0.06 nb nb 259.00 0.08 nb nb

LEGEND

LEASE of            
VEHICLES for 2005    

DAILY, WEEKLY  and  
MONTHLY

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

COMPACT  SIZED  AUTOMOBILES

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

Bid Summary       
ITEM  1

PRICES  SHOWN        
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

Orion Chevrolet 
Oldsmobile Ltd

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

60-months, non-maintenance lease

36 Months

36-months, non-maintenance lease

60-months, full-maintenance lease

36 Months

Vickar                
Chevrolet

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

National              
Car Rental

Fleet                 
Vehicle Agency

60-months, non-maintenance lease

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  522-2004 

Page  1  of  28

nb = no bid

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

36-months, non-maintenance lease

Falcon Auto           
Leasing Inc.

60-months, full-maintenance lease

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

ITEM   1....................Page  1  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

35.47 0.00 nb nb 36.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb

199.47 0.00 nb nb 234.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb

694.47 0.00 nb nb 875.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb

619.47 0.00 nb nb 720.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb

619.47 0.10 nb nb nb nb 479.00 0.00 nb nb

619.47 0.10 337.37 0.10 nb nb 430.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 419.00 0.00 nb nb

619.47 0.10 nb nb nb nb 360.00 0.00 nb nb

$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

36.00 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb

214.00 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb

829.00 0.06 600.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb

809.00 0.06 600.00 0.10 638.00 0.08 nb nb

809.00 0.06 nb nb 361.00 0.08 nb nb

799.00 0.06 317.00 0.10 341.00 0.08 451.07 0.11

809.00 0.06 nb nb 336.00 0.08 nb nb

799.00 0.06 nb nb 286.00 0.08 nb nb

MID  SIZED  AUTOMOBILES

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

Orion Chevrolet 
Oldsmobile Ltd

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

Bid Summary         
ITEM  2

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

36 Months

36-months, non-maintenance lease

Vickar                
Chevrolet

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  522-2004 

60-months, full-maintenance lease

60-months, non-maintenance lease

National              
Car Rental

Page  2  of  28

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE
LEASE of            

VEHICLES for 2005    
DAILY, WEEKLY  and  

MONTHLY
 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

60-months, non-maintenance lease

Fleet                 
Vehicle Agency

Falcon Auto           
Leasing Inc.

36 Months LEGEND
36-months, non-maintenance lease

nb = no bid
60-months, full-maintenance lease

ITEM   2....................Page  2  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

38.47 0.00 nb nb 43.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb

219.47 0.00 nb nb 260.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb

774.47 0.00 nb nb 925.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb

688.47 0.00 nb nb 770.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb

688.47 0.10 nb nb nb nb 709.00 0.00 nb nb

688.47 0.10 355.97 0.10 nb nb 660.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 599.00 0.00 nb nb

688.47 0.10 nb nb nb nb 550.00 0.00 nb nb

$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

39.00 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb

231.00 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb

899.00 0.06 nb nb nb nb nb nb

879.00 0.06 nb nb 670.00 0.08 nb nb

879.00 0.06 nb nb 415.00 0.08 nb nb

869.00 0.06 395.00 0.10 395.00 0.08 421.67 0.11

879.00 0.06 nb nb 391.00 0.08 nb nb

869.00 0.06 nb nb 341.00 0.08 nb nb

FULL  SIZED  AUTOMOBILES

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

Orion Chevrolet 
Oldsmobile Ltd

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

36 Months

36-months, non-maintenance lease

60-months, full-maintenance lease

60-months, non-maintenance lease

Page  3  of  28

National              
Car Rental

Fleet                 
Vehicle Agency

Falcon Auto           
Leasing Inc.

nb = no bid
60-months, full-maintenance lease

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

60-months, non-maintenance lease

Bid Summary         
ITEM  3

WEEKLY  RATE

Vickar                
Chevrolet

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  522-2004 

36 Months LEGEND

LEASE of            
VEHICLES for 2005    

DAILY, WEEKLY  and  
MONTHLY

36-months, non-maintenance lease

ITEM   3....................Page  3  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb 920.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb 760.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 542.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb 372.27 0.10 nb nb 483.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 462.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 403.00 0.00 nb nb

$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb 635.00 0.10 nb nb

nb nb nb nb 450.00 0.10 nb nb

nb nb nb nb 430.00 0.10 697.84 0.11

nb nb nb nb 395.00 0.10 nb nb

nb nb nb nb 345.00 0.10 nb nb

MINI  CARGO  VANS

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

Orion Chevrolet 
Oldsmobile Ltd

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

36 Months

36-months, non-maintenance lease

60-months, full-maintenance lease

60-months, non-maintenance lease

Page  4 of  24

National              
Car Rental

Fleet                 
Vehicle Agency

Falcon Auto           
Leasing Inc.

nb = no bid
60-months, full-maintenance lease

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

60-months, non-maintenance lease

Bid Summary         
ITEM  4

WEEKLY  RATE

Vickar                
Chevrolet

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  522-2004 

36 Months LEGEND

LEASE of            
VEHICLES for 2005    

DAILY, WEEKLY  and  
MONTHLY

36-months, non-maintenance lease

ITEM   4....................Page  4  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

38.47 0.00 nb nb 48.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

239.47 0.00 nb nb 270.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

784.47 0.00 nb nb 980.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

674.47 0.00 nb nb 835.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

674.47 0.15 nb nb nb nb 529.00 0.00 nb nb

674.47 0.15 353.19 0.10 nb nb 470.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 451.00 0.00 nb nb

674.47 0.15 nb nb nb nb 392.00 0.00 nb nb

$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

48.00 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb

285.00 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb

949.00 0.07 649.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb

929.00 0.07 649.00 0.10 680.00 0.08 nb nb

929.00 0.07 nb nb 436.00 0.08 nb nb

919.00 0.07 381.00 0.10 416.00 0.08 nb nb

929.00 0.07 nb nb 404.00 0.08 nb nb

919.00 0.07 nb nb 354.00 0.08 nb nb

MINI  PASSENGER  VANS

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

Orion Chevrolet 
Oldsmobile Ltd

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

36 Months

36-months, non-maintenance lease

60-months, full-maintenance lease

60-months, non-maintenance lease

Page  5  of  24

National              
Car Rental

Fleet                 
Vehicle Agency

Falcon Auto           
Leasing Inc.

nb = no bid
60-months, full-maintenance lease

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

60-months, non-maintenance lease

Bid Summary         
ITEM  5

WEEKLY  RATE

Vickar                
Chevrolet

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  522-2004 

36 Months LEGEND

LEASE of            
VEHICLES for 2005    

DAILY, WEEKLY  and  
MONTHLY

36-months, non-maintenance lease

ITEM   5....................Page  5  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

34.47 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

189.47 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

719.47 0.00 nb nb 790.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

669.47 0.00 nb nb 715.00 0.08 nb nb 820.00 0.15

669.47 0.15 nb nb nb nb 554.00 0.00 nb nb

669.47 0.15 380.72 0.10 nb nb 495.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 472.00 0.00 nb nb

669.47 0.15 nb nb nb nb 413.00 0.00 nb nb

$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

37.00 0.05 nb nb nb nb nb nb

203.00 0.05 nb nb nb nb nb nb

850.00 0.05 600.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb

850.00 0.05 600.00 0.10 574.00 0.10 nb nb

850.00 0.05 nb nb 479.00 0.10 nb nb

850.00 0.05 435.00 0.10 459.00 0.10 481.72 0.11

850.00 0.05 nb nb 401.00 0.10 nb nb

850.00 0.05 nb nb 351.00 0.10 nb nb

1/2   TON  CARGO  VANS

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

Orion Chevrolet 
Oldsmobile Ltd

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

36 Months

36-months, non-maintenance lease

60-months, full-maintenance lease

60-months, non-maintenance lease

Page  6  of  28

National              
Car Rental

Fleet                 
Vehicle Agency

Falcon Auto           
Leasing Inc.

nb = no bid
60-months, full-maintenance lease

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

60-months, non-maintenance lease

Bid Summary         
ITEM  6

WEEKLY  RATE

Vickar                
Chevrolet

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  522-2004 

36 Months LEGEND

LEASE of            
VEHICLES for 2005    

DAILY, WEEKLY  and  
MONTHLY

36-months, non-maintenance lease

ITEM   6....................Page  6  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 603.00 0 nb nb

nb nb 408.41 0.10 nb nb 544.00 0 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 513.00 0 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 454.00 0 nb nb

$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb 799.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb

nb nb 799.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb 456.00 0.10 nb nb 512.21 0.11

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

1/2   TON  PASSENGER  VANS

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

Orion Chevrolet 
Oldsmobile Ltd

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

36 Months

36-months, non-maintenance lease

60-months, full-maintenance lease

60-months, non-maintenance lease

Page  7  of  28

National              
Car Rental

Fleet                 
Vehicle Agency

Falcon Auto           
Leasing Inc.

nb = no bid
60-months, full-maintenance lease

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

60-months, non-maintenance lease

Bid Summary         
ITEM  7

WEEKLY  RATE

Vickar                
Chevrolet

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  522-2004 

36 Months LEGEND

LEASE of            
VEHICLES for 2005    

DAILY, WEEKLY  and  
MONTHLY

36-months, non-maintenance lease

ITEM   7....................Page  7  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb 1,450.00 0.13 nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb 1,250.00 0.13 nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 642.00 0 nb nb

nb nb 485.48 0.10 nb nb 583.00 0 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 546.00 0 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 487.00 0 nb nb

$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

89.00 0.11 nb nb nb nb nb nb

529.00 0.11 nb nb nb nb nb nb

1,849.00 0.11 999.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb

1,829.00 0.11 999.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb

1,829.00 0.11 nb nb nb nb nb nb

1,819.00 0.11 nb nb nb nb 556.29 0.11

1,829.00 0.11 nb nb nb nb nb nb

1,819.00 0.11 nb nb nb nb nb nb

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

3/4   TON  PASSENGER  VANSBid Summary         
ITEM  8

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

Orion Chevrolet 
Oldsmobile Ltd

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Vickar                
Chevrolet

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  522-2004 

Fleet                 
Vehicle Agency

Falcon Auto           
Leasing Inc.

National              
Car Rental

36 Months

36-months, non-maintenance lease

60-months, full-maintenance lease

60-months, non-maintenance lease

Page  8  of  28

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE
LEASE of            

VEHICLES for 2005    
DAILY, WEEKLY  and  

MONTHLY
 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

60-months, non-maintenance lease

36 Months LEGEND
36-months, non-maintenance lease

nb = no bid
60-months, full-maintenance lease

ITEM   8....................Page  8  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

44.47 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

278.47 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

974.47 0.00 nb nb 1,200.00 0.15 nb nb nb nb

898.47 0.00 nb nb 970.00 0.15 nb nb nb nb

898.47 0.20 nb nb nb nb 761.00 0.00 nb nb

898.47 0.20 560.22 0.10 nb nb 702.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 644.00 0.00 nb nb

898.47 0.20 nb nb nb nb 585.00 0.00 nb nb

$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

51.00 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb

306.00 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb

1,049.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb nb nb

1,029.00 0.08 nb nb 980.00 0.12 nb nb

1,029.00 0.08 nb nb 717.00 0.12 nb nb

1,019.00 0.08 637.00 0.10 697.00 0.12 474.21 0.11

1,029.00 0.08 nb nb 609.00 0.12 nb nb

1,019.00 0.08 nb nb 559.00 0.12 nb nb

MID SIZED SPORTS UTILITY VEHICLE - 4WD

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

Orion Chevrolet 
Oldsmobile Ltd

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

36 Months

36-months, non-maintenance lease

60-months, full-maintenance lease

60-months, non-maintenance lease

Page  9  of  28

National              
Car Rental

Fleet                 
Vehicle Agency

Falcon Auto           
Leasing Inc.

nb = no bid
60-months, full-maintenance lease

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

60-months, non-maintenance lease

Bid Summary         
ITEM  9

WEEKLY  RATE

Vickar                
Chevrolet

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  522-2004 

36 Months LEGEND

LEASE of            
VEHICLES for 2005    

DAILY, WEEKLY  and  
MONTHLY

36-months, non-maintenance lease

ITEM   9....................Page  9  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb 1,450.00 0.12 nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb 1,200.00 0.12 nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 923.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb 770.18 0.10 nb nb 864.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 779.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 720.00 0.00 nb nb

$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

69.00 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb

409.00 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb

1,429.00 0.07 nb nb nb nb nb nb

1,409.00 0.07 nb nb 1,584.00 0.12 nb nb

1,409.00 0.07 nb nb 839.00 0.12 nb nb

1,399.00 0.07 nb nb 819.00 0.12 nb nb

1,409.00 0.07 nb nb 775.00 0.12 nb nb

1,399.00 0.07 nb nb 705.00 0.12 nb nb

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

FULL SIZED SPORTS UTILITY VEHICLE - 4WDBid Summary         
ITEM  10

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

Orion Chevrolet 
Oldsmobile Ltd

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Vickar                
Chevrolet

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  522-2004 

Fleet                 
Vehicle Agency

Falcon Auto           
Leasing Inc.

National              
Car Rental

36 Months

36-months, non-maintenance lease

60-months, full-maintenance lease

60-months, non-maintenance lease

Page  10  of  28

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE
LEASE of            

VEHICLES for 2005    
DAILY, WEEKLY  and  

MONTHLY
 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

60-months, non-maintenance lease

36 Months LEGEND
36-months, non-maintenance lease

nb = no bid
60-months, full-maintenance lease

ITEM   10....................Page  10  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

39.47 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

248.47 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

844.47 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

779.47 0.00 nb nb nb nb 618.00 0.10 875.00 0.15

779.47 0.20 nb nb nb nb 457.00 0.00 nb nb

779.47 0.20 326.77 0.10 nb nb 398.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 390.00 0.00 nb nb

779.47 0.20 nb nb nb nb 331.00 0.00 nb nb

$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb 649.00 0.08 nb nb

nb nb nb nb 418.00 0.08 nb nb

nb nb 351.00 0.10 398.00 0.08 nb nb

nb nb nb nb 404.00 0.08 nb nb

nb nb nb nb 354.00 0.08 nb nb

1/4 TON, EXTENDED CAB PICK-UP TRUCKS - 2WD

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

Orion Chevrolet 
Oldsmobile Ltd

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

36 Months

36-months, non-maintenance lease

60-months, full-maintenance lease

60-months, non-maintenance lease

Page  11  of  28

National              
Car Rental

Fleet                 
Vehicle Agency

Falcon Auto           
Leasing Inc.

nb = no bid
60-months, full-maintenance lease

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

60-months, non-maintenance lease

Bid Summary         
ITEM  11

WEEKLY  RATE

Vickar                
Chevrolet

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  522-2004 

36 Months LEGEND

LEASE of            
VEHICLES for 2005    

DAILY, WEEKLY  and  
MONTHLY

36-months, non-maintenance lease

ITEM   11....................Page  11  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

39.47 0 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

248.47 0 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

844.47 0 nb nb 980.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

779.47 0 nb nb 870.00 0.08 796.00 0.10 895.00 0.15

779.47 0.20 nb nb nb nb 571.00 0.00 nb nb

779.47 0.20 376.08 0.10 nb nb 512.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 486.00 0.00 nb nb

779.47 0.20 nb nb nb nb 427.00 0.00 nb nb

$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

38.00 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb

228.00 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb

925.00 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb

879.00 0.00 nb nb 649.00 0.08 nb nb

895.00 0.00 nb nb 418.00 0.08 nb nb

879.00 0.00 463.00 0.10 398.00 0.08 541.36 0.11

859.00 0.00 nb nb 404.00 0.08 nb nb

859.00 0.00 nb nb 354.00 0.08 nb nb

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

1/4 TON, EXTENDED CAB PICK-UP TRUCKS - 4WDBid Summary         
ITEM  12

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

Orion Chevrolet 
Oldsmobile Ltd

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Vickar                
Chevrolet

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  522-2004 

Fleet                 
Vehicle Agency

Falcon Auto           
Leasing Inc.

National              
Car Rental

36 Months

36-months, non-maintenance lease

60-months, full-maintenance lease

60-months, non-maintenance lease

Page  12  of  28

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE
LEASE of            

VEHICLES for 2005    
DAILY, WEEKLY  and  

MONTHLY
 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

60-months, non-maintenance lease

36 Months LEGEND
36-months, non-maintenance lease

nb = no bid
60-months, full-maintenance lease

ITEM   12....................Page  12  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

39.47 0.00 nb nb 44.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

248.47 0.00 nb nb 260.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

844.47 0.00 nb nb 900.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

779.47 0.00 nb nb 775.00 0.08 722.00 0.10 985.00 0.15

779.47 0.20 nb nb nb nb 523.00 0.00 nb nb

779.47 0.20 360.07 0.10 nb nb 464.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 446.00 0.00 nb nb

779.47 0.20 nb nb nb nb 387.00 0.00 nb nb

$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb 575.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb

nb nb 575.00 0.10 695.00 0.10 nb nb

nb nb nb nb 503.00 0.10 nb nb

nb nb 364.00 0.10 483.00 0.10 nb nb

nb nb nb nb 508.00 0.10 nb nb

nb nb nb nb 458.00 0.10 nb nb

1/2 TON PICK-UP TRUCKS - 2WD

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

Orion Chevrolet 
Oldsmobile Ltd

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

36 Months

36-months, non-maintenance lease

60-months, full-maintenance lease

60-months, non-maintenance lease

Page  13  of  28

National              
Car Rental

Fleet                 
Vehicle Agency

Falcon Auto           
Leasing Inc.

nb = no bid
60-months, full-maintenance lease

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

60-months, non-maintenance lease

Bid Summary         
ITEM  13

WEEKLY  RATE

Vickar                
Chevrolet

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  522-2004 

36 Months LEGEND

LEASE of            
VEHICLES for 2005    

DAILY, WEEKLY  and  
MONTHLY

36-months, non-maintenance lease

ITEM   13....................Page  13  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

39.47 0.00 nb nb 44.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

248.47 0.00 nb nb 260.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

844.47 0.00 nb nb 920.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

779.47 0.00 nb nb 775.00 0.08 858.00 0.10 985.00 0.15

779.47 0.20 nb nb nb nb 610.00 0.00 nb nb

779.47 0.20 365.85 0.10 nb nb 551.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 519.00 0.00 nb nb

779.47 0.20 nb nb nb nb 460.00 0.00 nb nb

$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

45.00 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb

269.00 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb

999.00 0.00 575.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb

979.00 0.00 575.00 0.10 695.00 0.10 nb nb

979.00 0.08 nb nb 503.00 0.10 nb nb

969.00 0.08 441.00 0.10 483.00 0.10 nb nb

979.00 0.08 nb nb 508.00 0.10 nb nb

969.00 0.08 nb nb 458.00 0.10 nb nb

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

1/2 TON PICK-UP TRUCKS - 4WDBid Summary         
ITEM  14

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

Orion Chevrolet 
Oldsmobile Ltd

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Vickar                
Chevrolet

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  522-2004 

Fleet                 
Vehicle Agency

Falcon Auto           
Leasing Inc.

National              
Car Rental

36 Months

36-months, non-maintenance lease

60-months, full-maintenance lease

60-months, non-maintenance lease

Page  14  of  28

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE
LEASE of            

VEHICLES for 2005    
DAILY, WEEKLY  and  

MONTHLY
 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

60-months, non-maintenance lease

36 Months LEGEND
36-months, non-maintenance lease

nb = no bid
60-months, full-maintenance lease

ITEM   14....................Page  14  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

48.47 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

298.47 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

884.47 0.00 nb nb 1,035.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb

814.47 0.05 nb nb 915.00 0.10 881.00 0.10 1,315.00 0.15

nb nb nb nb nb nb 625.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb 397.78 0.10 nb nb 566.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 531.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 472.00 0.00 nb nb

$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb 699.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb

nb nb 699.00 0.10 947.00 0.12 nb nb

nb nb nb nb 644.00 0.12 nb nb

nb nb nb nb 619.00 0.12 nb nb

nb nb nb nb 633.00 0.12 nb nb

nb nb nb nb 558.00 0.12 nb nb

3/4   TON   PICK - UP   TRUCKS  - 2WD

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

Orion Chevrolet 
Oldsmobile Ltd

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

36 Months

36-months, non-maintenance lease

60-months, full-maintenance lease

60-months, non-maintenance lease

Page  15  of  28

National              
Car Rental

Fleet                 
Vehicle Agency

Falcon Auto           
Leasing Inc.

nb = no bid
60-months, full-maintenance lease

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

60-months, non-maintenance lease

Bid Summary         
ITEM  15

WEEKLY  RATE

Vickar                
Chevrolet

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  522-2004 

36 Months LEGEND

LEASE of            
VEHICLES for 2005    

DAILY, WEEKLY  and  
MONTHLY

36-months, non-maintenance lease

ITEM   15....................Page  15  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

48.47 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

298.47 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

884.47 0.00 nb nb 1,035.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb

814.47 0.05 nb nb 915.00 0.10 973.00 0.10 1,345.00 0.15

nb nb nb nb nb nb 684.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb 408.91 0.10 nb nb 625.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 580.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 521.00 0.00 nb nb

$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

51.00 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb

299.00 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb

1,189.00 0.08 699.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb

1,169.00 0.08 699.00 0.10 947.00 0.12 nb nb

1,169.00 0.08 nb nb 644.00 0.12 nb nb

1,159.00 0.08 nb nb 619.00 0.12 nb nb

1,169.00 0.08 nb nb 633.00 0.12 nb nb

1,159.00 0.08 nb nb 558.00 0.12 nb nb

Bid Summary         
ITEM  16

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

Orion Chevrolet 
Oldsmobile Ltd

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

3/4   TON   PICK - UP   TRUCKS  - 4WD

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

36 Months

Fleet                 
Vehicle Agency

Falcon Auto           
Leasing Inc.

Vickar                
Chevrolet

36-months, non-maintenance lease

60-months, full-maintenance lease

60-months, non-maintenance lease

Page  16  of  28

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE
LEASE of            

VEHICLES for 2005    
DAILY, WEEKLY  and  

MONTHLY
 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

60-months, non-maintenance lease

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  522-2004 

National              
Car Rental

36 Months LEGEND
36-months, non-maintenance lease

nb = no bid
60-months, full-maintenance lease

ITEM   16....................Page  16  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

39.47 0.00 nb nb 44.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

248.47 0.00 nb nb 260.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

844.47 0.00 nb nb 900.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

779.47 0.00 nb nb 795.00 0.08 872.00 0.10 985.00 0.15

779.47 0.20 nb nb nb nb 619.00 0.00 nb nb

779.47 0.20 380.21 0.10 nb nb 560.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 526.00 0.00 nb nb

779.47 0.20 nb nb nb nb 467.00 0.00 nb nb

$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb 575.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb

nb nb 575.00 0.10 695.00 0.10 nb nb

nb nb nb nb 503.00 0.10 nb nb

nb nb 435.00 0.10 483.00 0.10 454.23 0.11

nb nb nb nb 508.00 0.10 nb nb

nb nb nb nb 458.00 0.10 nb nb

1/2   TON, EXTENDED CAB  PICK - UP TRUCKS  - 2WD

60-months, non-maintenance lease

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

36 Months

36-months, non-maintenance lease
nb = no bid

60-months, full-maintenance lease

LEGEND

LEASE of            
VEHICLES for 2005    

DAILY, WEEKLY  and  
MONTHLY

36 Months

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

Orion Chevrolet 
Oldsmobile Ltd

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  522-2004 

Page  17  of  28

National              
Car Rental

Fleet                 
Vehicle Agency

Falcon Auto           
Leasing Inc.

Vickar                
Chevrolet

WEEKLY  RATE

Bid Summary         
ITEM  17

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

36-months, non-maintenance lease

60-months, full-maintenance lease

60-months, non-maintenance lease

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

DAILY  RATE

ITEM   17....................Page  17  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

39.47 0.00 nb nb 46.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

248.47 0.00 nb nb 290.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

844.47 0.00 nb nb 990.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb

779.47 0.00 nb nb 865.00 0.08 987.00 0.10 985.00 0.15

779.47 0.20 nb nb nb nb 694.00 0.00 nb nb

779.47 0.20 387.09 0.10 nb nb 634.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 588.00 0.00 nb nb

779.47 0.20 nb nb nb nb 529.00 0.00 nb nb

$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

45.00 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb

269.00 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb

999.00 0.00 575.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb

979.00 0.08 575.00 0.10 695.00 0.10 nb nb

979.00 0.08 nb nb 503.00 0.10 nb nb

969.00 0.08 516.00 0.10 483.00 0.10 494.91 0.11

979.00 0.08 nb nb 508.00 0.10 nb nb

969.00 0.08 nb nb 458.00 0.10 nb nb

Bid Summary         
ITEM  18

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

Orion Chevrolet 
Oldsmobile Ltd

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

1/2   TON, EXTENDED CAB  PICK - UP TRUCKS - 4WD

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

36 Months

Fleet                 
Vehicle Agency

Falcon Auto           
Leasing Inc.

Vickar                
Chevrolet

36-months, non-maintenance lease

60-months, full-maintenance lease

60-months, non-maintenance lease

Page  18  of  28

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE
LEASE of            

VEHICLES for 2005    
DAILY, WEEKLY  and  

MONTHLY
 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

60-months, non-maintenance lease

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  522-2004 

National              
Car Rental

36 Months LEGEND
36-months, non-maintenance lease

nb = no bid
60-months, full-maintenance lease

ITEM   18....................Page  18  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

48.47 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

298.47 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

884.47 0.00 nb nb 1,085.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb

814.47 0.05 nb nb 915.00 0.10 959.00 0.10 1,345.00 0.15

nb nb nb nb nb nb 675.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb 424.84 0.10 nb nb 616.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 573.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 514.00 0.00 nb nb

$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb 947.00 0.12 nb nb

nb nb nb nb 644.00 0.12 nb nb

nb nb nb nb 619.00 0.12 536.78 0.11

nb nb nb nb 633.00 0.12 nb nb

nb nb nb nb 558.00 0.12 nb nb

3/4  TON, EXTENDED CAB  PICK - UP TRUCKS  - 2WD

60-months, non-maintenance lease

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

36 Months

36-months, non-maintenance lease
nb = no bid

60-months, full-maintenance lease

LEGEND

LEASE of            
VEHICLES for 2005    

DAILY, WEEKLY  and  
MONTHLY

36 Months

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

Orion Chevrolet 
Oldsmobile Ltd

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  522-2004 

Page  19  of  28

National              
Car Rental

Fleet                 
Vehicle Agency

Falcon Auto           
Leasing Inc.

Vickar                
Chevrolet

WEEKLY  RATE

Bid Summary         
ITEM  19

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

36-months, non-maintenance lease

60-months, full-maintenance lease

60-months, non-maintenance lease

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

DAILY  RATE

ITEM   19....................Page  19  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

48.47 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

298.47 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

884.47 0.00 nb nb 1,085.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb

814.47 0.05 nb nb 915.00 0.10 1,064.00 0.10 1,395.00 0.15

nb nb nb nb nb nb 743.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb 449.05 0.10 nb nb 684.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 629.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 570.00 0.00 nb nb

$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

51.00 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb

299.00 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb

1,189.00 0.08 nb nb nb nb nb nb

1,169.00 0.08 nb nb 947.00 0.12 nb nb

1,169.00 0.08 nb nb 644.00 0.12 nb nb

1,159.00 0.08 530.00 0.10 619.00 0.12 545.56 0.11

1,169.00 0.08 nb nb 633.00 0.12 nb nb

1,159.00 0.08 nb nb 558.00 0.12 nb nb

Bid Summary         
ITEM  20

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

Orion Chevrolet 
Oldsmobile Ltd

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

3/4  TON, EXTENDED CAB  PICK - UP TRUCKS  - 4WD

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

36 Months

Fleet                 
Vehicle Agency

Falcon Auto           
Leasing Inc.

Vickar                
Chevrolet

36-months, non-maintenance lease

60-months, full-maintenance lease

60-months, non-maintenance lease

Page  20  of  28

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE
LEASE of            

VEHICLES for 2005    
DAILY, WEEKLY  and  

MONTHLY
 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

60-months, non-maintenance lease

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  522-2004 

National              
Car Rental

36 Months LEGEND
36-months, non-maintenance lease

nb = no bid
60-months, full-maintenance lease

ITEM   20....................Page  20  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

48.47 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

298.47 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

884.47 0.00 nb nb 1,380.00 0.12 nb nb nb nb

814.47 0.05 nb nb 1,100.00 0.12 1,055.00 0.10 1,395.00 0.15

nb nb nb nb nb nb 737.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb 458.14 0.10 nb nb 678.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 624.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 565.00 0.00 nb nb

$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb 1,062.00 0.12 nb nb

nb nb nb nb 667.00 0.12 nb nb

nb nb 510.00 0.10 642.00 0.12 nb nb

nb nb nb nb 644.00 0.12 nb nb

nb nb nb nb 569.00 0.12 nb nb

CREW CAB  PICK - UP TRUCKS  - 2WD

60-months, non-maintenance lease

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

36 Months

36-months, non-maintenance lease
nb = no bid

60-months, full-maintenance lease

LEGEND

LEASE of            
VEHICLES for 2005    

DAILY, WEEKLY  and  
MONTHLY

36 Months

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

Orion Chevrolet 
Oldsmobile Ltd

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  522-2004 
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National              
Car Rental

Fleet                 
Vehicle Agency

Falcon Auto           
Leasing Inc.

Vickar                
Chevrolet

WEEKLY  RATE

Bid Summary         
ITEM  21

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

36-months, non-maintenance lease

60-months, full-maintenance lease

60-months, non-maintenance lease

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

DAILY  RATE

ITEM   21....................Page  21  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

48.47 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

298.47 0.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

884.47 0.00 nb nb 1,380.00 0.12 nb nb nb nb

814.47 0.00 nb nb 1,100.00 0.12 1,181.00 0.10 1,395.00 0.15

nb nb nb nb nb nb 818.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb 481.47 0.10 nb nb 759.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 692.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 633.00 0.00 nb nb

$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

65.00 0.11 nb nb nb nb nb nb

369.00 0.11 nb nb nb nb nb nb

1,305.00 0.11 nb nb nb nb nb nb

1,305.00 0.11 nb nb 1,062.00 0.12 nb nb

1,305.00 0.11 nb nb 667.00 0.12 nb nb

1,305.00 0.11 566.00 0.10 642.00 0.12 nb nb

1,305.00 0.11 nb nb 644.00 0.12 nb nb

1,305.00 0.11 nb nb 569.00 0.12 nb nb

Bid Summary         
ITEM  22

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

Orion Chevrolet 
Oldsmobile Ltd

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

CREW CAB  PICK - UP TRUCKS  - 4WD

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

36 Months

Fleet                 
Vehicle Agency

Falcon Auto           
Leasing Inc.

Vickar                
Chevrolet

36-months, non-maintenance lease

60-months, full-maintenance lease

60-months, non-maintenance lease
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DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE
LEASE of            

VEHICLES for 2005    
DAILY, WEEKLY  and  

MONTHLY
 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

60-months, non-maintenance lease

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  522-2004 

National              
Car Rental

36 Months LEGEND
36-months, non-maintenance lease

nb = no bid
60-months, full-maintenance lease
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NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb 1,380.00 0.12 nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb 1,100.00 0.12 1,051.00 0.10 1,395.00 0.15

nb nb nb nb nb nb 734.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb 459.95 0.10 nb nb 675.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 622.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 563.00 0.00 nb nb

$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb 1,392.00 0.12 nb nb

nb nb nb nb 748.00 0.12 nb nb

nb nb nb nb 718.00 0.12 nb nb

nb nb nb nb 675.00 0.12 nb nb

nb nb nb nb 600.00 0.12 nb nb

1 TON, EXTENDED CAB  PICK - UP TRUCKS  - 2WD  -  DRW

60-months, non-maintenance lease

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

36 Months

36-months, non-maintenance lease
nb = no bid

60-months, full-maintenance lease

LEGEND

LEASE of            
VEHICLES for 2005    

DAILY, WEEKLY  and  
MONTHLY

36 Months

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

Orion Chevrolet 
Oldsmobile Ltd

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  522-2004 
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National              
Car Rental

Fleet                 
Vehicle Agency

Falcon Auto           
Leasing Inc.

Vickar                
Chevrolet

WEEKLY  RATE

Bid Summary         
ITEM  23

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

36-months, non-maintenance lease

60-months, full-maintenance lease

60-months, non-maintenance lease

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

DAILY  RATE
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NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb 1,380.00 0.12 nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb 1,100.00 0.12 1,164.00 0.10 1,395.00 0.15

nb nb nb nb nb nb 807.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb 473.46 0.10 nb nb 748.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 683.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 624.00 0.00 nb nb

$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

65.00 0.11 nb nb nb nb nb nb

369.00 0.11 nb nb nb nb nb nb

1,305.00 0.11 nb nb nb nb nb nb

1,305.00 0.11 nb nb 1,392.00 0.12 nb nb

1,305.00 0.11 nb nb 748.00 0.12 nb nb

1,305.00 0.11 nb nb 718.00 0.12 nb nb

1,305.00 0.11 nb nb 675.00 0.12 nb nb

1,305.00 0.11 nb nb 600.00 0.12 nb nb

Bid Summary         
ITEM  24

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

Orion Chevrolet 
Oldsmobile Ltd

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

1 TON, EXTENDED CAB  PICK - UP TRUCKS  - 4WD  -  DRW

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

36 Months

Fleet                 
Vehicle Agency

Falcon Auto           
Leasing Inc.

Vickar                
Chevrolet

36-months, non-maintenance lease

60-months, full-maintenance lease

60-months, non-maintenance lease
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DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE
LEASE of            

VEHICLES for 2005    
DAILY, WEEKLY  and  

MONTHLY
 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

60-months, non-maintenance lease

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  522-2004 

National              
Car Rental

36 Months LEGEND
36-months, non-maintenance lease

nb = no bid
60-months, full-maintenance lease

ITEM   24....................Page  24  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb 1,350.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb 1,190.00 0.10 1,022.00 0.10 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 716.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 657.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 607.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 548.00 0.00 nb nb

$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  522-2004 

National              
Car Rental

36-months, non-maintenance lease
nb = no bid

60-months, full-maintenance lease
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Fleet                 
Vehicle Agency

Falcon Auto           
Leasing Inc.

Vickar                
Chevrolet

60-months, non-maintenance lease

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

36 Months LEGEND

LEASE of            
VEHICLES for 2005    

DAILY, WEEKLY  and  
MONTHLY

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

36-months, non-maintenance lease

60-months, full-maintenance lease

60-months, non-maintenance lease

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

36 Months

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Bid Summary         
ITEM  25

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

Orion Chevrolet 
Oldsmobile Ltd

1 TON, 2WD STAKE BODY TRUCKS  - REGULAR OR EXTENDED
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NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb 1,375.00 0.10 nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb 1,195.00 0.10 1,084.00 0.10 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 815.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 756.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 639.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 580.00 0.00 nb nb

$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

Bid Summary         
ITEM  26

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

Orion Chevrolet 
Oldsmobile Ltd

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

1 TON, 2WD DUMP BODY TRUCKS  - REGULAR OR EXTENDED

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

36 Months

Fleet                 
Vehicle Agency

Falcon Auto           
Leasing Inc.

Vickar                
Chevrolet

36-months, non-maintenance lease

60-months, full-maintenance lease

60-months, non-maintenance lease

Page  26  of  28

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE
LEASE of            

VEHICLES for 2005    
DAILY, WEEKLY  and  

MONTHLY
 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

60-months, non-maintenance lease

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  522-2004 

National              
Car Rental

36 Months LEGEND
36-months, non-maintenance lease

nb = no bid
60-months, full-maintenance lease

ITEM   26....................Page  26  of  28



NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb 1,750.00 0.15 nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb 1,650.00 0.15 1,873.00 0.10 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 1,292.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 1,203.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 1,082.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 1,003.00 0.00 nb nb

$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  522-2004 

National              
Car Rental

36-months, non-maintenance lease
nb = no bid

60-months, full-maintenance lease
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Fleet                 
Vehicle Agency

Falcon Auto           
Leasing Inc.

Vickar                
Chevrolet

60-months, non-maintenance lease

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

36 Months LEGEND

LEASE of            
VEHICLES for 2005    

DAILY, WEEKLY  and  
MONTHLY

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

36-months, non-maintenance lease

60-months, full-maintenance lease

60-months, non-maintenance lease

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

36 Months

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

Bid Summary         
ITEM  27

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

Orion Chevrolet 
Oldsmobile Ltd

14, 000# GVWR, 2WD DUMP BODY TRUCKS  - CREW CAB
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NOTE

1 $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb 1,750.00 0.15 nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb 1,650.00 0.15 1,872.00 0.10 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 1,351.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 1,262.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 1,092.00 0.00 nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb 1,003.00 0.00 nb nb

$ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km $ Std  Ch $ / km

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

Bid Summary         
ITEM  28

PRICES  SHOWN               
do  not  include

Enterprise            
Rent-A-Car

Orion Chevrolet 
Oldsmobile Ltd

The Driving Force Inc. 
(Driving Force).

Calmont              
Leasing Ltd.

14, 000# GVWR, 4WD DUMP BODY TRUCKS  - CREW CAB

Cam Clark Ford       
Sales (Wpg) Ltd.

P.S.T.    or    G.S.T

DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE

 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

36 Months

Fleet                 
Vehicle Agency

Falcon Auto           
Leasing Inc.

Vickar                
Chevrolet

36-months, non-maintenance lease

60-months, full-maintenance lease

60-months, non-maintenance lease
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DAILY  RATE

WEEKLY  RATE
LEASE of            

VEHICLES for 2005    
DAILY, WEEKLY  and  

MONTHLY
 1  MONTH to less than 6  MONTHS

 6  MONTHS to less than 12  MONTHS

60-months, non-maintenance lease

BID  RESULTS        
TENDER  522-2004 

National              
Car Rental

36 Months LEGEND
36-months, non-maintenance lease

nb = no bid
60-months, full-maintenance lease
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