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DESCRIPTION: PROVISION OF ELEVATOR, ESCALATOR AND DUMBWAITER  
MAINTENANCE SERVICES 
VARIOUS LOCATIONS 
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K 

AWARD BY 
LOCATION 

L 

KONE 306,540.00 12,520.00 14,080.00 12,520.00 23,080.00 28,240.00 129,400.00 11,680.00 21,400.00 14,080.00 12,880.00 12,520.00 14,140.00

OTIS CANADA NO BID 6,000.00 6,540.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 137,580.00 NO BID NO BID 6,660.00 6,420.00 6,000.00 NO BID

WINNIPEG ELEVATOR NO BID NO BID 12,480.70 NO BID 28,977.46 60,702.34 NO BID NO BID NO BID 12,480.70 11,846.02 NO BID NO BID

THYSSENKRUPP 246,360.00 10,291.00 11,575.00 9,655.00 21,787.00 30,.991.00 117,979.00 7,435.00 19,831.00 9,355.00 8,071.00 11,575.00 9,727.00

INTER-CITY ELEVATOR NO BID 10,975.00 10,975.00 10,975.00 15,775.00 35,275.00 NO BID 7,975.00 17,875.00 10,975.00 10,975.00 10,975.00 10,975.00


